
ATTACHMENT 1

Invitation for Bids No. F14-94

Public Safety Uniforms & Equipment

Bid Summary

LC Action Police Supply Summit Uniforms

1088 N First St 545-A Meridian Ave

San Jose CA 95112 San Jose CA 95126

Stacy Moore Patrick Earnshaw

408-294-2677 408-293-8633

DESCRIPTION SPECIFICATIONS COMMENTS OR OTHER BRAND OFFERED

UNIT COST 

YEAR ONE

UNIT COST 

YEAR TWO

UNIT COST 

YEAR THREE COMMENTS OR OTHER BRAND OFFERED

UNIT COST 

YEAR ONE

UNIT COST 

YEAR TWO

UNIT COST 

YEAR THREE

ASP BATON 26"  ASP, 26" - No substitutions ASP 52611 64.35 79.00 79.00 79.00

ASP BATON HOLDER ASP ASP 52633 28.39 39.00 39.00 39.00

BADGE HOLDER Dutyman Dutyman 5304 Round badge holder 6.02 Strong 80747-273 24.00 24.00 24.00

BALLISTIC VEST Second Chance- SM01-3A00S-SM01 - No substitutions As specified 725.00 799.00 799.00 799.00

BALLISTIC VEST COVERS Second Chance - No substitutions As specified 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00

BATON HOLDER Bianchi 7313 Bianchi 7313 9.59 No longer makes

BATON RING Bianchi Bianchi 7904 5.80 12.00 12.00 12.00

BELT, DUTY BAM 7950, 1137 Bianchi 7950 32.70 55.00 55.00 55.00

BELT, DUTY Bianchi 7980 Bianchi 7980 32.70 55.00 55.00 55.00

BELT, DUTY Bianchi Buckleless 7970 Bianchi 7970 39.77 69.00 69.00 69.00

BELT, DUTY Bianchi Sam Browne 7960 Bianchi 7960 38.88 69.00 69.00 69.00

BELT, DUTY Bianchi Nylon, 7200 Bianchi 7200 27.77 49.00 49.00 49.00

BELT, DUTY Bianchi Accumold, Webgear Bianchi 7210 Duty belt 19.94 Bianchi 7203 38.00 38.00 38.00

BELT, PANTS Bianchi 7205 Bianchi 7205 15.40 25.00 25.00 25.00

BELT, PANTS Bianchi, Garrison B8V Safariland 51 garrison belt 19.69 No longer makes

BELT, PANTS Bianchi Accumold, Webgear Bianchi 7210 Duty belt 19.94 Bianchi 7205 25.00 25.00 25.00

BELT, SWAT Bianchi Web Belt Bianchi 7202 1.75" belt 21.46 Bianchi 7203 38.00 38.00 38.00

BLOUSING BANDS Vanguard Coast Guard Boot Bands Blousing bands 4.95 2.00 2.00 2.00

BOOTS, MOTOR Dehner NO BID All American 905L 389.00 389.00 389.00

BOOTS, POLICE ACAD. Thorogood 834-6111 NO BID 169.00 169.00 169.00

BOOTS, POLICE ACADEMY Rocky 5066 Rocky Boot 5066 129.00

CAP, BASEBALL, BLUE WITH PATCH (Civilian) Richardson 514 NO BID 16.00 16.00 16.00

CAP, DRESS Hankin NO BID 99.00 99.00 99.00

CHEST PROTECTOR, MFF Hatch Centurion Hatch CDX2500 chest/shoulder 84.57 89.00 89.00 89.00

DIGITAL RECORDER POUCH Bianchi 7303 Bianchi 7303 12.12 19.00 19.00 19.00

DOUBLE MAG POUCH Bianchi 7302 Bianchi 7302 18.06 32.00 32.00 32.00

DOUBLE MAG POUCH Bianchi Threat III, 7922 Bianchi 7922 18.43 32.00 32.00 32.00

DOUBLE MAG POUCH Bianchi 7902, 1138 Bianchi 7902 23.23 39.00 39.00 39.00

ELBOW PADS, MFF Hatch Centurion NE35 Hatch NE35 7.50 14.00 14.00 14.00

FLASHLIGHT W/CONE & A/C CHARGER Pelican 8060 - No substitutions Pelican 8060 + 80520R 132.07 149.00 149.00 149.00

FLASHLIGHT HOLDER Bianchi 7909 Bianchi 7909 5.05 9.00 9.00 9.00

FLASHLIGHT HOLDER, BIANCHI, #7311 Bianchi 7311 Bianchi 7311 13.88 25.00 25.00 25.00

FLEX CUFFS, MFF Plastic Zip-Tie Safariland 8210, 10/pk 7.87 each 1.00 1.00 1.00

Not to exceed 5% increase 
upon documented 

manufacturers' cost increase 
for all items bid.
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FOREARM PADS, MFF Hatch Centurion Hatch FP100 forearm 15.82 FP100 16.00 16.00 16.00

GEAR BAG, MFF Hatch M2 Hatch M2 bag 45.47 69.00 69.00 69.00

GLOVES, MFF Hatch Centorian Hatch MP100 gloves 56.53 39.00 39.00 39.00

GLOVES, WHITE PROCESSIONAL Vanguard White parade gloves 4.99 6.00 6.00 6.00

HANDCUFF CASE, DOUBLE Bianchi 7917 Bianchi 7917 21.09 39.00 39.00 39.00

HANDCUFF CASE, DOUBLE, WEBGEAR Bianchi 7317 Bianchi 7317 17.17 29.00 29.00 29.00

HANDCUFF CASE, SINGLE Bianchi 7900 Bianchi 7900 17.42 32.00 32.00 32.00

HANDCUFF KEY, HEAVY DUTY Bianchi Accumold 7916 Bianchi 7916 13.26 Key holder 28.00 28.00 28.00

HANDCUFF/MAG COMBO, PADDLEBACK Bianchi, Blk Leather -to fit 9mm, .40 & .45 cal Glock Bianchi 45 mag/cuff 34.34 59.00 59.00 59.00

HANDCUFFS, CHAINED Peerless Chrome - No substitutions Peerless 700 21.80 32.00 32.00 32.00

HANDCUFFS, HINGED Peerless Chrome Peerless 801 30.60 48.00 48.00 48.00

HASHMARK Embroidered sleeve, various colors as needed NO BID 2.00 2.00 2.00

HAT, SWAT (CAMO) Richardson NO BID

HAT, CAMPAIGN Stratton S-40DB Stratton at S40DB 89.00 79.00 79.00 79.00

HAT, DRESS Lancaster NO BID

HAT, DRESS, CHIEF ONLY (CUSTOM SCRAMBLE) Lancaster NO BID Hankin 149.00 149.00 149.00

HELMET COVER, TRUSPEC Tru Spec 5937 Truespec 5937 8.96 10.00 10.00 10.00

HELMET, MOTORCYCLE Shoei RJ-Platinum Air LE Shoei RJ Platinum Air LE 499.00 399.00 399.00 399.00

HOLSTER PANCAKE (for Glock 9mm, 40 & 45) Bianchi 60 / 83 Bianchi Shadow 7 32.70 59.00 59.00 59.00

HOLSTER, SWAT, TACTICAL THIGH Safariland 6004 Safariland 6004 no light 108.33 149.00 149.00 149.00

HOOD, SWAT, BLK, NOMEX Hatch MT2000 Hatch NH2500 nomex hood 9.47 NH2500 15.00 15.00 15.00

INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Large LT. Bars Vanguard Large LT bars 12.99 11.00 11.00 11.00

INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Small LT. Bars Vanguard Small LT bars 12.99 9.00 9.00 9.00

JACKET, BICYCLE, BLK ( Liner & Custom Print) Mocean 2150 Avalanche w/reflect tape NO BID 239.00 239.00 239.00

JACKET, DUTY Blauer 6120 NO BID 149.00 149.00 149.00

JACKET, GANG UNIT/RAID Royal Blue poly unlined windbreaker NO BID 39.00 39.00 39.00

JACKET, IKE Sinatra NO BID 279.00 279.00 279.00

JACKET, RAID Royal Blue poly unlined windbreaker NO BID 39.00 39.00 39.00

JACKET, RECORDS, FORMAL, BLU, POLYWOOL Lady Edwards Security Guard Blazer NO BID 149.00 149.00 149.00

KEEPERS, BAM, 4-PACK Bianchi 7906 Bianchi 7906 7.32 14.00 14.00 14.00

KEEPERS, BIANCHI NYLON Bianchi 7406 Bianchi 7406 6.95 14.00 14.00 14.00

KEY STRAP, BAM, SILENT Bianchi 7916 Bianchi 7916 13.26 28.00 28.00 28.00

KEY STRAP, WEBGEAR Bianchi 7316 Bianchi 7316 11.49 23.00 23.00 23.00

KNEE PADS, MFF Centurion 250 Hatch KP250 knee pads 13.98 KP250 22.00 22.00 22.00

LANYARD (Whistle) Windsor Whistle NO BID 2.00 2.00 2.00

NAMETAG METAL (LIST SIL/BLK, SIL/BLU, OR GLD/BLU) Classic Blackinten J1 name bar 14.00 12.00 12.00 12.00

NAMETAG, PLASTIC EXPLORER Eddie NO BID Classic 12.00 12.00 12.00

NAMETAPE, CLOTH Eddie NO BID 8.00 8.00 8.00

NUMBERTAPE, CLOTH, BLK/SIL Eddie NO BID 8.00 8.00 8.00

O.C. HOLDER Bianchi 7907 Bianchi 7907 16.79 29.00 29.00 29.00
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O.C. HOLDER, BAM, OPEN TOP Bianchi 7908 Bianchi 7908 13.51 24.00 24.00 24.00

O.C. HOLDER, NYLON - OPEN Bianchi 7308 Bianchi 7308 13.51 19.00 19.00 19.00

O.C. HOLDER, WEBGEAR - CLOSED/NYLON Bianchi Accumold 7310 Bianchi 7310 10.10 19.00 19.00 19.00

O.C. SPRAY, MK4 & MK4C Defence Technologies MKIV Defense Technologies 5049 8.47 15.00 15.00 15.00

O.C. SPRAY, SMALL  MK3 Defence Technologies MKIII Defense Technologies 5039 7.55 14.00 14.00 14.00

PATCH, CLOTH STAR, CAPT Schweizer Emblems NO BID 4.00 4.00 4.00

PATCH, CLOTH STAR, GOLD Schweizer Emblems NO BID 4.00 4.00 4.00

PATCH, CLOTH STAR, LT Schweizer Emblems NO BID 4.00 4.00 4.00

PATCH, CLOTH STAR, PSO Schweizer Emblems NO BID 4.00 4.00 4.00

PATCH, CLOTH STAR, SUBDUED Schweizer Emblems NO BID 4.00 4.00 4.00

PATCH, CLOTH STAR, SWAT SUBDUED Schweizer Emblems NO BID 4.00 4.00 4.00

PATCH, FLAG Schweizer Emblems NO BID 4.00 4.00 4.00

PATCH, MOTOR WHEEL, SET Schweizer Emblems NO BID 10.00 10.00 10.00

PATCHES, CLOTH 'POLICE' STAR Schweizer Emblems NO BID 4.00 4.00 4.00

PATCHES, DPS PATROL Schweizer Emblems NO BID 4.00 4.00 4.00

PATCHES, EXPLORER Schweizer Emblems NO BID 4.00 4.00 4.00

RADIO HOLDER Bianchi 7923 Bianchi 7923 24.49 42.00 42.00 42.00

RADIO HOLDER Bianchi Universal 7914S Bianchi 7324            ? 29.79 49.00 49.00 49.00

RADIO HOLDER Bianchi 7324 Bianchi 7324 17.80 29.00 29.00 29.00

RAIL MOUNTED LIGHT POUCH Bianchi 7327 Bianchi 7327 10.48 19.00 19.00 19.00

RAINGEAR,  ANIMAL CONTROL Blauer 9691 (No "Police" on back) NO BID With hood 279.00 279.00 279.00

RAINGEAR,  JACKET Blauer 9691 NO BID With hood 279.00 279.00 279.00

RAINGEAR, BLAUER, JACKET, CSO BLAUER 233R with hood NO BID 169.00 169.00 169.00

RAINGEAR,  PANTS 5.11 48057 NO BID 119.00 119.00 119.00

RAINGEAR, HOOD Blauer (w/Jacket) NO BID 20.00 20.00 20.00

SHIN GUARDS, MFF Hatch Centurion NO BID TS70 59.00 59.00 59.00

SHIRTS, ANIMAL CONTROL, S/S TAN W/W SHIRT Flying Cross 69R6604 NO BID 49.00 49.00 49.00

SHIRTS, ANIMAL CONTROL, L/S TAN W/W SHIRT Flying Cross 19W6604 NO BID 59.00 59.00 59.00

SHIRTS, BIKE, POLO, BLK W/ NAMETAPE Blauer 8130 NO BID 59.00 59.00 59.00

SHIRTS, CADET, L-SLEEVE, TAN, CLOTH Dickies Poly Cotton RN20967 NO BID 29.00 29.00 29.00

SHIRTS, CADET, S-SLEEVE, TAN, CLOTH Dickies Poly cotton NO BID 25.00 25.00 25.00

SHIRTS, CPA/AN.CONTROL, L-SLEEVE, TAN, POLY Flying Cross 19W6604 NO BID 59.00 59.00 59.00

SHIRTS, CPA/ANM.CONTROL, S-SLEEVE, TAN, POLY Flying Cross 69R6604 NO BID 49.00 49.00 49.00

SHIRTS, CSI/K-9, L-SLEEVE, BLU, BDU Blauer 8703 NO BID 54.00 54.00 54.00

SHIRTS, CSI/K-9, S-SLEEVE, BLU, BDU Blauer 8713 NO BID 49.00 49.00 49.00

SHIRTS, EXPLORER, L-SLEEVE, LITE BLUE Blauer 8431 NO BID Elbeco 878 44.00 44.00 44.00

SHIRTS, EXPLORER, S-SLEEVE, LITE BLUE Blauer 8421 NO BID Elbeco 868 39.00 39.00 39.00

SHIRTS, FIRE BLAUER, L-SLEEVE, BLU Blauer 8255, women's sizes available NO BID 59.00 59.00 59.00

SHIRTS, FIRE BLAUER, S-SLEEVE, BLU Blauer 8256, women's sizes available NO BID 54.00 54.00 54.00

SHIRTS, FIRE COMMAND, WHITE, L/S Flying Cross 45W6600 NO BID 59.00 59.00 59.00
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SHIRTS, FIRE COMMAND, WHITE, S/S Flying Cross 95R6600 NO BID 49.00 49.00 49.00

SHIRTS, FIRE PREVENTION, WHITE L/S Elbesco 877 NO BID 44.00 44.00 44.00

SHIRTS, FIRE PREVENTION, WHITE S/S Elbesco 867 NO BID 39.00 39.00 39.00

SHIRTS, INCLEMENT WEATHER Blauer 8703 NO BID 54.00 54.00 54.00

SHIRTS, MANAGER,RECORDS & DISPATCH, L/S Elbeco Paragon Plus 811, 867 NO BID 44.00 44.00 44.00

SHIRTS, MANAGER,RECORDS & DISPATCH, S/S Elbeco Paragon Plus  801, 877 NO BID 39.00 39.00 39.00

SHIRTS, MFF, L/S, BLK Propper 2412 NO BID 5.11 74003 54.00 54.00 54.00

SHIRTS, NVI/PEO, L/S, LIGHT BLUE Flying Cross 45W6625 NO BID 59.00 59.00 59.00

SHIRTS, NVI/PEO, S/S, LIGHT BLUE Flying Cross 95R6625 NO BID 49.00 49.00 49.00

SHIRTS, PATROL, L-SLEEVE, 100% WOOL Flying Cross 20W9586 NO BID 89.00 89.00 89.00

SHIRTS, PATROL, L-SLEEVE, POLYESTER, Flying Cross 48W6686 NO BID 59.00 59.00 59.00

SHIRTS, PATROL, S-SLEEVE, 100% WOOL Flying Cross 70R9586 NO BID 79.00 79.00 79.00

SHIRTS, PATROL, S-SLEEVE, POLYESTER, Flying Cross 98R6686 NO BID 49.00 49.00 49.00

SHIRTS, POLICE ACADEMY (Light Blue) Horace Small (Red Cap) Model SP56mB7 NO BID 29.00 29.00 29.00

SHIRTS, RECORDS, L-SLEEVE, WHITE Edwards  Women 5077, Men 1077 NO BID Elbeco 801/877 44.00 44.00 44.00

SHIRTS, RECORDS, S-SLEEVE, WHITE Edwards  Women 811, Men 867 NO BID Elbeco 39.00 39.00 39.00

SHIRTS, SWAT, COMBAT Tru-Spec Combat Shirt 2550 Truespec 2550 54.37 74.00 74.00 74.00

SHIRTS, SWAT, MULTI-CAM Tru-Spec 1265 Truespec 1265 54.93 74.00 74.00 74.00

SHIRTS, TAC, L-SLEEVE, BLK, BDU, W/NUMBERTAPE Propper Ripstop Propper 545212 BDU w/tape 25.99 5.11 74003 54.00 54.00 54.00

SHOES, BIKE Magnum or Rocky, Quarter Length NO BID Reebok 8180 84.00 84.00 84.00

SHORTS, BIKE, BLK, BDU Mocean, TR601 NO BID Pant & short combo 2058 99.00 99.00 99.00

SHOULDER PADS, MFF/CHEST PROTECTOR Hatch, Centurion Hatch CDX2500 Upper body/shoulder 84.39 KPX2500 89.00 89.00 89.00

SKIRTS, RECORDS, BLU, POLY/WOOL Edwards 9789 NO BID No longer make

SL 20X BATTERY Streamlight - for SL-20X StreamLight 20175 29.24 39.00 39.00 39.00

SL 20X W/AC CHARGER Streamlight - for SL-20X StreamLight 26060 96.44 129.00 129.00 129.00

SWAT, COVERED COMP LIGHT HOLDER Bianchi Bianchi 7911 compact light holder 16.91 19.00 19.00 19.00

SWAT, FIELD JACKET Propper, No Patches Propper F455025 BDU coat 18.04 159.00 159.00 159.00

SWAT, FLASHLIGHT Stinger XT-75013 Streamlight StreamLight 75013 91.62 129.00 129.00 129.00

SWAT, GLOVES Hatch KSG500, Kevlar Shooting Hatch KSG500 gloves 24.18 29.00 29.00 29.00

SWAT, JACKET Gortex Hatch MT2000 Hatch NH2500 nomex hood - wrong item No longer make

SWAT, MAGAZINE POUCH Bianchi Accumold, Close Top 7302 Bianchi 7302 7.95 29.00 29.00 29.00

SWAT, MAGAZINE POUCH Bianchi Accumold, Open Top 7320 Bianchi 7320 16.04 29.00 29.00 29.00

SWAT, WEB BELT Bianchi Accumold Bianchi 7210 Duty belt 19.94 39.00 39.00 39.00

SWEATER, RECORDS, CARDIGAN, BLU SF Knitting, 5600 Button-up NO BID 54.00 54.00 54.00

SWEATER, RECORDS, V-NECK, BLU SF Knitting, 6500 Button-up NO BID 39.00 39.00 39.00

TIE CLIP Gold or Silver, Vanguard 7.00 6.00 6.00 6.00

TIE CLIP, SUNNYVALE Hook fast NO BID 8.00 8.00 8.00

TIE, BLACK S. Broome  Clip-on NO BID 7.00 7.00 7.00

TIE, BOWTIE, BLUE, SOUTHER STYLE, RECORDS S. Broome  Snap-on NO BID 7.00 7.00 7.00

TIE, NAVY, PATROL S. Broome  Clip-on NO BID 7.00 7.00 7.00
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TROUSERS, ANIM. CTRL, BLACK Blauer 8810 NO BID 69.00 69.00 69.00

TROUSERS, BICYCLE, BLK Mocean, Blk 2050 NO BID Pant & short combo 2058 99.00 99.00 99.00

TROUSERS, BLAUER, FIRE BDU Blauer 8215 NO BID 69.00 69.00 69.00

TROUSERS, CADET, TAN, CLOTH Dickies 640 NO BID 29.00 29.00 29.00

TROUSERS, CPA, TAN, POLYESTER Fechheimer 46351 NO BID #918 69.00 69.00 69.00

TROUSERS, CSI/K-9, BLU BDU'S Blauer 8810 NO BID 69.00 69.00 69.00

TROUSERS, FIRE PREVENTION, NAVY Flying Cross Wool (16oz) Navy Fire Pant NO BID 99.00 99.00 99.00

TROUSERS, MANAGER, RECORDS & DISPATCH Flying Cross SUMTRS01 NO BID 99.00 99.00 99.00

TROUSERS, MOTOR BRITCHES Sinatra NO BID United 10303 269.00 269.00 269.00

TROUSERS, PATROL, 100% WOOL Fechheimer 32289 NO BID 99.00 99.00 99.00

TROUSERS, PATROL, POLYESTER Fechheimer 38289 NO BID 59.00 59.00 59.00

TROUSERS, PROPERTY, 5.11 TATICAL PRO 5.11 Style# 64360, 74273 5.11 64360 34.70 69.00 69.00 69.00

TROUSERS, RECORDS, BLU, POLY/WOOL Edwards 8783-07  or Flying Cross 39400W or 39400 NO BID Poly rayon lycra FX39489 74.00 74.00 74.00

TROUSERS, SWAT, MULTI-CAM Tru-Spec Tac Response Pant 1266 Truespec 1266 54.93 74.00 74.00 74.00

TROUSERS, TAC, BLK, BDU'S, SIZE-SPECIFIC Propper 5000's NO BID 5.11 72002 54.00 54.00 54.00

WHISTLE, BLACK Acme, Blk Plastic Acme black plastic 5.99 3.00 3.00 3.00

WHISTLE, CHROME Acme, Chrome Acme chrome 8.99 7.00 7.00 7.00

WINDBREAKER, CHAPLAIN, W/PATCHES Blue Polyester windbreaker, no lining NO BID 39.00 39.00 39.00
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MILPITAS-ONLY ITEMS

PANTS, MENS, MIDNIGHT BLUE Workrite #400NX75  Nomex NO BID 99.00 99.00 99.00

SHIRT, MENS, SHORT SLEEVE, MIDNIGHT BLUE Workrite #730NX45  Nomex NO BID 84.00 84.00 84.00

SHIRT, MENS, LONG SLEEVE, MIDNIGHT BLUE Workrite #735NX45  Nomex NO BID 99.00 99.00 99.00

PANTS, WOMENS, MIDNIGHT BLUE Workrite #401NX75 NO BID 99.00 99.00 99.00

SHIRT, WOMENS, SHORT SLEEVE, MIDNIGHT BLUE Workrite #731NX45 NO BID 84.00 84.00 84.00

SHIRT, WOMENS, LONG SLEEVE, MIDNIGHT BLUE Workrite NO BID 99.00 99.00 99.00

ALTERATIONS/REPAIRS

   Cut tails NO BID 10.00

   Dart back NO BID 15.00

   Hash marks NO BID 2.00

   Re-hem pants NO BID No charge N/C N/C N/C

   Remove hash marks NO BID No charge N/C N/C N/C

   Remove patches NO BID No charge N/C N/C N/C

   Sew patches - jacket NO BID No charge N/C N/C N/C

   Sew patches - shirt NO BID No charge N/C N/C N/C

   Shorten crotch NO BID 15.00 15.00 15.00

   Shorten sleeves NO BID 10.00 10.00 10.00

   Take in sides NO BID 15.00 15.00 15.00

   Take in sides & sleeves NO BID 15.00 15.00 15.00

   Take in waist/let out waist NO BID No charge N/C N/C N/C

   Zippers in customer's garments NO BID 12.00 12.00 12.00

   Custom Alterations Per 1/2 hour NO BID 20.00 20.00 20.00

Per hour NO BID 40.00 40.00 40.00

*  No charge for patches or star

*  All uniforms must have employee ID#
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