City of Sunnyvale, California
IFB No. F15-26 for Thirteen (13) Service Trucks

Attachment 1

Bidder Tracy Ford Towne Ford Sales Big Valley Ford Frontier Ford Albany Ford Serramonte Ford Downtown Ford Sales
Address 3500 Auto Plaza Way 1601 El Camino Real 3282 Auto Center Circle |3701 Stevens Creek Blvd |718 San Pablo Ave 999 Serramonte Blvd. 525 N 16th St
Santa Clara CA 95051-
Tracy, CA 95304 Redwood City CA 94063 |Stockton, CA 95212 7396 Albany CA 94706 Colma, CA 94014 Sacramento CA 95811
Item [Pricing Qty Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price

1{1 Ton regular cab/chassis with 7ft flatbed 1 $ 34,636.56 | S 38,175.00| $ 34,970.00| $ 34,250.00| $ 35,141.56 | $ 35,080.50| $ 35,230.00
2|1.5 Ton Extended Cab with Service Body 1l s 61,348.56 | $ 68,050.00( $ 65,555.00( $ 61,600.00| $ 61,903.56| $ 61,692.50 | $ 61,797.00
3|Extended Cab Compack Pickup 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4{1/2 Ton Extended Cab Pickup Truck, 2WD 2 No Bid $ 45,900.00( $ 46,490.00( $ 46,800.00( $ 46,055.86| S 47,598.43| S 47,234.00
5|3/4 ton Extended Cab Pickup Truck 2WD 2 No Bid $ 43,400.00| $ 44,380.00] $ 43,800.00] $ 44,043.84] $ 45,181.10| S 44,830.00

1 Ton regular cab/chassis 2WD DERW 84"
6|CTA 1 s 37,752.56 No Bid S 35,655.00 | $ 37,933.00( $ 38,352.56 | $ 38,311.50| $ 38,346.00

3/4 Ton regular cab/chassis 2WD SRW 56"
7|CTA 1] S 23,592.92 No Bid S 25,700.00| $ 23,800.00| $ 23,983.92( $ 23,982.50] S 24,177.00
8|1 Ton regular cab cone Truck 13,500 GVWR 1 No Bid $ 51,500.00| $ 40,905.00( $ 50,223.00 No Bid S 45,866.50 No Bid
9|1 Ton regular cab with service body, DRW 1] S 44,788.46( $ 44,990.00( $ 48,139.00( $ 45,100.00| $ 45,379.56| S 45,068.50 $ 45,273.00

Tire Fees (51.75 each) S 33.25( $ 35.00( $ 2450 $ 12.25

CONTRACT AWARD UNDER CITY MANAGER

AUTHORITY $ 89,335.00| $ 76,584.50| $ 34,262.25

RECOMMENDED CITY COUNCIL CONTRACT

AWARD $ 129,763.19

Note: The Ford Store of San Leandro and North Bay Ford of Santa Cruz submitted bids with pricing and specification errors and were deemed to be non-responsive.
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