Attachment 1

Invitation for Bids No. F18-141 \
Asphaltic Materials and Pavement Reinforcement Fabric
Bid Summary | |
Bidder Graniterock Reed & Graham _
Address 365 Blomquist Street 690 Sunol Street 650 South Delong Street
Redwood City, CA San Jose, CA 95126 Salt Lake City, Utah 84104
Contact Donita Granado Peter Fitzpatrick n/a
BID ITEMS Freight not included in pricing.
1. Emulsion Oils
a. SS-1-H (2,500 Gal) $3.10/GAL $7,750.00 $3.45/GAL $8,625.00
Plant Site Redwood City San Jose
b. PM-CRS-2H (135,000 gal) No Bid [$3.15/GAL $425,250.00
Plant Site‘ San Jose
¢. CRO (45,000 gal) No Bid [$3.05/GAL $137,250.00
Plant Site San Jose
2. Asphalt Concrete (COLD)
a. 1/4" Maximum (100 tons) $113.10/TON $11,310.00 |$102.00/TON $10,200.00
Plant Site ‘ Redwood City San Jose
3. Asphalt Concrete (HOT)
a. 1/4" Maximum (100 tons) $82.00/TON $8,200.00 $87.00/TON $8,700.00
Plant Site ‘ Redwood City San Jose
b. 3/8" Maximum (100 tons) $82.00/TON $8,200.00 $84.00/TON $8,400.00
Plant Site ‘ Redwood City San Jose
c. 1/2" Maximum (9,500 tons) $79.00/TON $750,500.00 |$70.00/TON $665,000.00
Plant Site ‘ Redwood City San Jose
d. 3/4" Maximum (950 tons) $78.00/TON $74,100.00 |$70.00/TON $66,500.00
Plant Site Redwood City San Jose
4. Crack Filler (80 tons) $2010.00/TON $160,800.00 |$1,895/TON $151,600.00 |$880.00/TON $ 70,400.00
Maxwell (30lb box each @ $30.00) Henry Maxwell Products
5. Pavement Coating (1,000 gal) $2.85/GAL $2,850.00 $3.25/GAL $3,250.00
NO BID/BULK $3.25/BULK $3,250.00
Plant Site Reed & Graham Reed & Graham
6. Hydro-Patch TA-92 (1,500bags) $14.00/BAG $21,000.00 $15/BAG $22,500.00
Plant Site Graniterock (Spec-Patch)
7. Pavement Membrane (20 box) NOBID | e $218.50/BOX $4,370.00
Propex
8. De Tack (1,500 gal) ‘ NOBD e |$85.00/5-GAL $25,500.00 |$40.00/5 Gallon Pails $ 12,000.00
Maxwell Products
1. Cleaning/Neutralizing NO BID 1. Cleaning/Neutralizing $275.00
2. Return of Broken Materials NO BID 2. Return of Broken Materials $125.00
Grand Total $48,000.00 $1,304,850.00 $ 82,400.00




