
Attachment 1

Invitation for Bids No. F16-114

Aggregate Base Materials

Bid Summary Bidder

Stevens Creek

  Quarry

Item Description Estimated Usage Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total

 Crushed Granite/Fine 1/4'' 2,600 Tons 43.78$                112,528.00$      No Bid -$                    

 Crushed Granite/Medium 3/8'' 3,500 Tons 43.78$                153,230.00$      No Bid -$                    

 Aggregate Base Recycled 3/4'' Class 2 3,200 Tons 14.71$                47,072.00$        17.06$               54,592.00$         

 Drain Rock 11/2''  3,000 Tons 38.78$                116,340.00$      29.13$               87,390.00$         

 Cold Mix/Cut Back 300 Tons 121.31$              36,393.00$        No Bid -$                    

 Permanent Asphalt Cold Patch 300 Bags 16.00$                4,800.00$          No Bid -$                    

 TOTAL TAX INCLUDED   470,363.00$      141,982.00$       

Bidder

Graniterock

Company


