
Invitation for Bids No. F24-013
Pipe and Miscellaneous Pipe Supplies

Vendor Name Core and Main Ferguson Ungerground Republic Water Works 
Address 3486 Investment Blvd 27750 Industrial Blvd 1175 Campbell Ave

Hayward, CA 94545 Hayward, CA 94545 San Jose, CA 95126
Contact Scott Silverthom Shane Stowe Jake Perez
Bid    
Item 
No.

Bid Description
Estimated  

Annual  
Usage

Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price

1.      2" Brass Cap   20 EA Brand: Merit Brass 17.30 Brand: Merit Brass 16.10 Brand: Matco 16.159
Product No: Product No: XNL116-32 Product No: B-CA08LF

2.      4" Gland Pack w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated 30 EA Brand: Sigma 40.00 Brand: Tyler 38.50 Brand: Tyler 36.171
 Retainer   Product No: 467115 Product No: Product No: 523352

3. 4" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated  10 EA Brand: Tyler 110.00 Brand: Tyler 122.00 Brand: Tyler 121.971
Domestic Product No: 397656 Product No: Product No: 395683

4 4" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated  10 EA Brand: Tyler 82.00 Brand: Tyler 83.90 Brand: Tyler 83.859
Import Product No: 031888 Product No: Product No: 031888

5 6" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated   40 EA Brand: Tyler 165.00 Brand: Tyler 184.30 Brand: Tyler 184.218
Domestic Product No: 395690 Product No: Product No: 395690

6 6" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated   40 EA Brand: Tyler 147.00 Brand: Tyler 147.00 Brand: Tyler 147.012
Import Product No: 31710 Product No: Product No: 031710

7 6" Gland Pack w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts and Epoxy Coated Retainer 80 EA Brand: Sigma 54.00 Brand: Tyler 47.40 Brand: Tyler 44.582
Product No: 467117 Product No: Product No: 523369

8 8" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated  20 EA Brand: Tyler 218.00 Brand: Tyler 242.30 Brand: Tyler 230.871
Domestic Product No: 397014 Product No: Product No: 397014

9 8" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated  20 EA Brand: Tyler 230.00 Brand: Tyler 230.90 Brand: Tyler 186.741
Import Product No: 031727 Product No: Product No: 031727

10 8" Gland Pack w/Tri-Pac Blue T-Bolts and Epoxy Coated Retainer 40 EA Brand: Sigma 59.00 Brand: Tyler 52.80 Brand: Tyler 49.629
Product No: 467118 Product No: Product No: 523376

11 10" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated  4 EA Brand: Tyler 313.00 Brand: Tyler 346.60 Brand: Tyler 346.565
Domestic Product No: 397657 Product No: Product No: 397656

12 10" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated  4 EA Brand: Tyler 273.00 Brand: Tyler 273.40 Brand: Tyler 273.318
Import Product No: 31826 Product No: Product No: 031826

13 10" Gland Pack w/Tri-Pac Blue T-Bolts and Epoxy Coated Retainer 14 EA Brand: Sigma 77.00 Brand: Tyler 72.40 Brand: Tyler 68.135
Product No: 467144 Product No: Product No: 523383

14 12" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated 4 EA Brand: Tyler 410.00 Brand: Tyler 456.80 Brand: Tyler 456.759
Domestic Product No: 397663 Product No: Product No: 397663

15 12" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated 4 EA Brand: Tyler 356.00 Brand: Tyler 356.20 Brand: Tyler 356.141
Import Product No: 031840 Product No: Product No: 031840

16 12" Gland Pack w/Tri-Pac Blue T-Bolts and Epoxy Coated Retainer 14 EA Brand: Sigma 80.00 Brand: Tyler 76.00 Brand: Tyler 71.500
Product No: 467145 Product No: Product No: 523390

17 2" Mueller Brass Elbow - IP x IP 20 EA Brand: Mueller 230.00 Brand: Merit Brass 22.40 Brand: Mueller 174.814
Product No: E15404N Product No: Product No: H-15538N

18 2" Mueller Brass Elbow - Comp x Comp 20 EA Brand: Mueller 270.00 Brand: Ford 261.80 Brand: AY 234.45
Product No: H15526N Product No: L44-77-Q-NL Product No: 5182-089

19 2" Mueller Brass Elbow - Comp x Female IP 20 EA Brand: Mueller 139.00 Brand: Ford 166.90 Brand: AY 149.462
Product No: H15533N Product No: L14-77-Q-NL Product No: 5182-185

20 2" Mueller Brass Elbow - Comp x Male IP 20 EA Brand: Mueller 156.00 Brand: Ford 151.20 Brand: AY 135.375
Product No: H15531N Product No: L84-77-Q-NL Product No: 5182-090

21 2" Mueller Brass Coupling - IP x IP 15 EA Brand: Mueller 230.00 Brand: Merit Brass 19.30 Brand: Mueller 237.154
Product No: E15404N Product No: Product No:

22 2" Mueller Brass Coupling - Comp x Comp 15 EA Brand: Mueller 130.00 Brand: Ford 125.50 Brand: AY 112.338
Product No: H15403N Product No: C44-77-Q-NL Product No: 5182-079

23 2" Mueller Brass Coupling - Comp x Female IP 15 EA Brand: Mueller 99.00 Brand: Ford 98.50 Brand: AY 88.188
Product No: H15451N Product No: C14-77-Q-NL Product No: 5182-087

24 2" Mueller Brass Coupling - Comp x Male IP 15 EA Brand: Mueller 98.00 Brand: Ford 94.30 Brand: AY 84.375
Product No: H15428N Product No: C84-77-Q-NL Product No: 5182-088

25 2" Mueller Brass Coupling - Meter Flange x Female 15 EA Brand: Mueller 150.00 Brand: Ford 75.30 Brand: AY 67.375
Product No: P10127 Product No: CF31-77-NL Product No: 5133-125

26 2" Smith & Blair Flex Flange 15 EA Brand: Smith Blair 71.00 Brand: Smith Blair 207.20 Brand: Smith-Blair 105.312
Product No: 931 Product No: 913-02380200-003 Product No: ERW-F-023802020-03

27 2" Mueller Brass Coupling - Angle Stop/Comp x Flange 15 EA Brand: Mueller 400.00 Brand: Ford 443.30 Brand: AY 416.888
Product No: B24276 Product No: BFA43-777W-Q-NL Product No: 5182-091

28 3" Mueller, A-2361 316 SS Bolts -Gate Valve FL x FL 24 EA Brand: Mueller 689.00 Brand: Clow 749.00 Brand: Clow 582.551
Product No: A2361 Product No: F6100 Gate Valve Product No: F6102

29 4" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxFL 10 EA Brand: Mueller 795.00 Brand: Clow 731.00 Brand: Clow 626.888
Product No: A2361 Product No: F6100 Gate Valve Product No: F6106

30 4" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxMJ 6 EA Brand: Mueller 795.00 Brand: Clow 766.00 Brand: Clow 656.633
Product No: A2361 Product No: F6100 Gate Valve Product No: F6100

31 4" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge FLxFL 24 EA Brand: Mueller 795.00 Brand: Clow 759.60 Brand: Clow 651.020
Product No: A2361 Product No: F6100 Gate Valve Product No: F6102

BID SUMMARY

Product Offered Product Offered Product Offered
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Invitation for Bids No. F24-013
Pipe and Miscellaneous Pipe Supplies

Vendor Name Core and Main Ferguson Ungerground Republic Water Works 
Address 3486 Investment Blvd 27750 Industrial Blvd 1175 Campbell Ave
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BID SUMMARY

Product Offered Product Offered Product Offered

32 6" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxMJ 15 EA Brand: Mueller 985.00 Brand: American AVK 890.00 Brand: Clow 837.908
Product No: A2361 Product No: 545 Gate Valve Product No: F6100

33 6" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge FLxFL 6 EA Brand: Mueller 1,020.00 Brand: American AVK 924.00 Brand: Clow 869.898
Product No: A2361 Product No: 545 Gate Valve Product No: F6102

34 6" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxFL 20 EA Brand: Mueller 985.00 Brand: American AVK 890.00 Brand: Clow 837.908
Product No: A2361 Product No: 545 Gate Valve Product No: F6106

35 8" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxMJ 15 EA Brand: Mueller 1,570.00 Brand: American AVK 1,416.00 Brand: Clow 1,334.592
Product No: A2361 Product No: 545 Gate Valve Product No: F6100

36 8" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge FLxFL 6 EA Brand: Mueller 1,600.00 Brand: American AVK 1,444.00 Brand: Clow 1,359.847
Product No: A2361 Product No: 545 Gate Valve Product No: F6102

37 8" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxFL 15 EA Brand: Mueller 1,550.00 Brand: American AVK 1,390.00 Brand: Clow 1,309.337
Product No: A2361 Product No: 545 Gate Valve Product No: F6106

38 10" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxMJ 6 EA Brand: Mueller 2,445.00 Brand: American AVK 2,208.00 Brand: Clow 2,081.020
Product No: A2361 Product No: 545 Gate Valve Product No: F6100

39 10" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge FLxFL 6 EA Brand: Mueller 2,540.00 Brand: American AVK 2,293.00 Brand: Clow 2,160.714
Product No: A2361 Product No: 545 Gate Valve Product No: F6102

40 10" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxFL 15 EA Brand: Mueller 2,445.00 Brand: American AVK 2,208.00 Brand: Clow 2,081.020
Product No: A2361 Product No: 545 Gate Valve Product No: F6106

41 12" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxMJ 15 EA Brand: Mueller 3,095.00 Brand: American AVK 2,794.00 Brand: Clow 2,633.265
Product No: A2361 Product No: 545 Gate Valve Product No: F6100

42 12" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge FLxFL 15 EA Brand: Mueller 3,080.00 Brand: American AVK 2,769.00 Brand: Clow 2,609.133
Product No: A2361 Product No: 545 Gate Valve Product No: F6102

43 12" Mueller Gate Valve, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxFL 15 EA Brand: Mueller 2,980.00 Brand: American AVK 2,666.00 Brand: Clow 2,512.602
Product No: A2361 Product No: 545 Gate Valve Product No: F6106

44 3/4" Curb Stop Mueller B-20200 with locking ear 20 EA Brand: Mueller 46.00 Brand: Ford 71.20 Brand: AY 66.975
 Product No: B20200 Product No: B11-333W-NL Product No: 5139-112

45 2" Curb Stop Mueller B-20200 with locking ear   24 EA Brand: Mueller 335.00 Brand: Ford 321.30 Brand: AY 302.35
Product No: B20200 Product No: B11-777W-NL Product No: 5139-183

46 2" Mueller Corp Stop B-25008, meets low lead requirement   24 EA Brand: Mueller 305.00 Brand: Ford 313.60 Brand: AY 294.838
Product No: B25008 Product No: FB1000-7-Q-NL Product No: 5182-167

47 1" Mueller Corp Stop B-25008, meets low lead requirement 24 EA Brand: Mueller 82.00 Brand: Ford 84.60 Brand: AY 79.525
Product No: B25008 Product No: FB1000-4-Q-NL Product No: 5182-049

48 3/4" Mueller Corp Stop B-25008, meets low lead requirement 24 EA Brand: Mueller 62.00 Brand: Ford 64.40 Brand: AY 60.475
Product No: B25008 Product No: FB1000-3-Q-NL Product No: 5182-028

49 3/4" IP x IP Brass Elbow  25 EA Brand: Merit Brass 5.30 Brand: Merit Brass 4.50 Brand: AY 26.801
Product No: Product No: Product No: H-15538N

50 Mueller Angle Meter Valve, H-14258 3/4", meet low lead req. 24 EA Brand: Mueller 52.00 Brand: Ford 56.10 Brand: AY 49.812
Product No: H14258 Product No: KV43-332W-Q-NL Product No: 5182-356

51 Mueller Straight Meter Valve, H-14258 3/4", meet low lead req. 24 EA Brand: Mueller 108.00 Brand: Ford 56.10 Brand: AY 94.875
Product No: H14258 Product No: KV43-332W-Q-NL Product No: 5182-038

52 Mueller Compression Union, H-15404 3/4", meet low lead req. 24 EA Brand: Mueller 32.00 Brand: Ford 30.30 Brand: AY 21.725
Product No: H15404 Product No: C66-33-Q-NL Product No: 5182-004

53 Mueller Compression Union, H-15404 1", meet low lead req. 24 EA Brand: Mueller 62.00 Brand: Ford 60.60 Brand: AY 24.863
Product No: H15404 Product No: C66-44-Q-NL Product No: 5182-001

54 Mueller Compression Union, H-15404 1 1/2", meet low lead req. 6 EA Brand: Mueller 98.00 Brand: Ford 132.00 Brand: AY 83.188
Product No: H15404 Product No: C66-66-IDR7-NL Product No: 5182-104

55 Mueller Compression Union, H-15404 2", meet low lead req. 12 EA Brand: Mueller 186.00 Brand: Ford 177.80 Brand: AY 112.338
Product No: H15404 Product No: C66-77-IDR7-NL Product No: 5182-079

56 Romac 4" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (8-inch length) OD 4.44-5.24 10 EA Brand: Romac 190.00 Brand: Ford 143.70 Brand: Romac 262.365
Product No: SS2-527X8 Product No: FS2 Clamp Full Circle Product No: 112-05270800

57 Romac 4" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (12-inch length) OD 4.44-5.24 10 EA Brand: Romac 294.00 Brand: Ford 214.00 Brand: Romac 408.079
Product No: SS2-527X12 Product No: FS2 Clamp Full Circle Product No: 112-05271200

58 Romac 6" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (8-inch length) OD 6.57-7.37 10 EA Brand: Romac 215.00 Brand: Ford 150.80 Brand: Romac 301.605
Product No: SS2-737X8 Product No: FS2 Clamp Full Circle Product No: 112-07370800

59 Romac 6" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (12-inch length) OD 6.57-7.37 10 EA Brand: Romac 320.00 Brand: Ford 220.00 Brand: Romac 441.96
Product No: SS2-737X12 Product No: FS2 Clamp Full Circle Product No: 112-07371200

60 Romac 8" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (8-inch length) OD 8.62-9.42 10 EA Brand: Romac 249.00 Brand: Ford 163.20 Brand: Romac 345.215
Product No: SS2-939X8 Product No: FS2 Clamp Full Circle Product No: 112-09390800

61 Romac 8" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (12-inch length) OD 8.62-9.42 10 EA Brand: Romac 363.00 Brand: Ford 235.00 Brand: Romac 502.107
Product No: SS2-937X12 Product No: FS2 Clamp Full Circle Product No: 112-09391200

62 Romac 10" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (8-inch length) OD 11.04-11.84 7 EA Brand: Romac 251.00 Brand: Ford 183.50 Brand: Romac 349.011
Product No: SS2-1184X8 Product No: FS2 Clamp Full Circle Product No: 112-11840800

63 Romac 10" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (12-inch length) OD 11.04-11.84 7 EA Brand: Romac 561.00 Brand: Ford 281.20 Brand: Romac 775.376
Product No: SS2-1184X12 Product No: FS2 Clamp Full Circle Product No: 112-11841200

64 Romac 12" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (8-inch length) OD 13.10-13.50 10 EA Brand: Romac 323.00 Brand: Ford 187.30 Brand: Romac 447.305
Product No: SS2-1350X8 Product No: FS2 Clamp Full Circle Product No: 112-13500800

65 Romac 12" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (12-inch length) OD 13.10-13.50 10 EA Brand: Romac 636.00 Brand: Ford 290.20 Brand: Romac 880.315
Product No: SS2-1350X12 Product No: FS2 Clamp Full Circle Product No: 112-13501200

66 Brass ¾” x 1” CC Short Bushing 12 EA Brand: Ford 19.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: AY 20.606
Product No: B8AA-43-NL Product No: Product No: 5132-406
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Invitation for Bids No. F24-013
Pipe and Miscellaneous Pipe Supplies

Vendor Name Core and Main Ferguson Ungerground Republic Water Works 
Address 3486 Investment Blvd 27750 Industrial Blvd 1175 Campbell Ave

Hayward, CA 94545 Hayward, CA 94545 San Jose, CA 95126
Contact Scott Silverthom Shane Stowe Jake Perez
Bid    
Item 
No.

Bid Description
Estimated  

Annual  
Usage

Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price

BID SUMMARY

Product Offered Product Offered Product Offered

67 Brass ¾” x 1” CC Long Bushing 12 EA Brand: Ford 30.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: AY 20.606
Product No: Product No: Product No: 5132-406

68 4" Megalug EBAA Series 1100 for DI & C900  12 EA Brand: EBAA 69.00 Brand: EBAA 85.30 Brand: EBBA 80.224
w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: 1104/2004 Product No: 1104DECEY Product No: 1104DECEY

69 6" Megalug EBAA Series 1100 for DI & C900   20 EA Brand: EBAA 96.00 Brand: EBAA 114.30 Brand: EBBA 107.565
w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: 1106/2006 Product No: 1106DECEY Product No: 1106DECEY

70 8" Megalug EBAA Series 1100 for DI & C900   20 EA Brand: EBAA 127.00 Brand: EBAA 147.40 Brand: EBBA 138.682
w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: 1108/2008 Product No: 1108DECEY Product No: 1108DECEY

71 3/4" x 4" Brass Nipple   20 EA Brand: Merit 5.80 Brand: Merit 5.50 Brand: Matco 5.804
Product No: Product No: Product No:

72 8" PVC Sewer Pipe, for GV Standpipe Use   200 FT Brand: NAPCO 12.30 Brand: Westlake Pipe 12.20 Brand: Vinyltech 13.106
Product No: SDR35 Product No: Product No:

73 3/4" x 6" Brass Nipple  20 EA Brand: Merit 6.00 Brand: Merit 8.00 Brand: Matco 8.477
Product No: Product No: Product No:

74 2" x 6" Brass Nipple      20 EA Brand: Merit 23.00 Brand: Merit 24.70 Brand: Matco 28.008
Product No: Product No: Product No:

75 2" x 4" Brass Nipple      30 EA Brand: Merit 17.20 Brand: Merit 16.70 Brand: Matco 18.971
Product No: Product No: Product No:

76 2" x 12" Brass Nipple  20 EA Brand: Merit 45.00 Brand: Merit 48.60 Brand: Matco 55.188
Product No: Product No: Product No:

77 2" IP Thread Plug      20 EA Brand: Merit 11.00 Brand: Merit 11.10 Brand: Matco 11.995
Product No: Product No: Product No:

78 2" Brass Pipe    400 FT Brand: Merit 75.00 Brand: Merit 52.00 Brand: Matco 113.333
Product No: Product No: Product No:

79 2" x 15" Brass Nipple 36 EA Brand: Merit 68.00 Brand: Merit No Bid Brand: Matco 96.612
Product No: Product No: Product No:

80 Clow Model 75 Fire Hydrant     20 EA Brand: Clow 2,620.00 Brand: Clow 2,999.00 Brand: Clow 3,109.588
Product No: #75 Product No: 75 Product No: 75

81 Christy G5 Box     50 EA Brand: Old Castle 52.00 Brand: Christy 51.90 Brand: Old Castle 54.69
Product No: G5 Product No: G5 Box Product No: G5

82 Christy G5 Cover     50 EA Brand: Old Castle 35.00 Brand: Christy 33.20 Brand: Old Castle 41.08
Product No: G5C Product No: G5C Product No: G5C

83 Christy F8 Sewer Box     60 EA Brand: Old Castle 24.00 Brand: Christy 25.50 Brand: Old Castle 26.691
Product No: F8 Product No: F8 Box Product No: F08

84 Christy F8 Sewer Cover    60 EA Brand: Old Castle 21.00 Brand: Christy 21.80 Brand: Old Castle 22.831
Product No: F8D Product No: F8D Product No: F08D

85 2" cc to 1" cc thread reducer brass bushing 24 EA Brand: Ford 79.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: AY 90.993
Product No: BBAA-74-NL Product No: Product No: 5132-411

86 2" cc to 3/4" cc thread reducer brass bushing 24 EA Brand: Ford 79.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: AY 88.98
Product No: BBAA-73-NL Product No: Product No: 5132-410

87 Blue Monster Emory Cloth 24 EA Brand: Blue Monster 9.50 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: Oatey 10.43
Product No: Product No: Product No:

88 4" Tri-Pac Blue T-Bolt Kits 48 EA Brand: Sigma 59.00 Brand: Tripac 22.00 Brand: Tripac 22.50
Product No: Product No: Product No:

89 6-8" Tri-Pac Blue T-Bolt Kits 1 1/4" wrench 96 EA Brand: Sigma 59.00 Brand: Tripac 35.40 Brand: Tripac 33.75
Product No: Product No: Product No:

90 10-12" Tri-Pac Blue T-Bolt Kits 1 1/4" wrench 96 EA Brand: Sigma 64.00 Brand: Tripac 47.10 Brand: Tripac 45.00
Product No: Product No: Product No:

91 2-3" Blue Tri-Pac Flange Bolt Kit 60 EA Brand: Tri Pac 15.00 Brand: Industrial Threaded Products 6.00 Brand: Tripac 11.25
#CL150A307 Product No: ILBOXIT/23 Product No: Product No:

92 4" Blue Tri-Pac Flange Bolt Kit 48 EA Brand: Tri Pac 30.00 Brand: Industrial Threaded Products 11.90 Brand: Tripac 27.775
#CL150A307 Product No: ILBOXIT/24 Product No: Product No:

93 6" Blue Tri-Pac Flange Bolt Kit 24 EA Brand: Tri Pac 39.60 Brand: Industrial Threaded Products 19.80 Brand: Tripac 31.875
#CL150A307 Product No: ILBOXIT/06 Product No: Product No:

94 8" Blue Tri-Pac Flange Bolt Kit 24 EA Brand: Tri Pac 39.60 Brand: Industrial Threaded Products 23.10 Brand: Tripac 32.50
#CL150A307 Product No: ILBOXIT/08 Product No: Product No:

95 10" Blue Tri-Pac Flange Bolt Kit 24 EA Brand: Tri Pac 85.00 Brand: Industrial Threaded Products 68.00 Brand: Tripac 71.588
#CL150A307 Product No: IBOXIT/10 Product No: Product No:

96 12" Blue Tri-Pac Flange Bolt Kit 24 EA Brand: Tri Pac 87.00 Brand: Industrial Threaded Products 70.70 Brand: Tripac 70.00
#CL150A307 Product No: IBOXIT/12 Product No: Product No:

97 4" Hydrant Cast Iron Breakaway Spools 12 EA Brand: No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:

98 6" Hydrant Cast Iron Breakaway Spools 12 EA Brand: Clow 238.00 Brand: Clow 271.30 Brand: Clow 255.294
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:

99 8" Hydrant Cast Iron Breakaway Spools 12 EA Brand: No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:

100 12" Hydrant Cast Iron Breakaway Spools 12 EA Brand: Clow 365.00 Brand: Clow 406.30 Brand: Clow 382.353
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:

101 24" Hydrant Cast Iron Breakaway Spools 12 EA Brand: Clow 515.00 Brand: Clow 577.50 Brand: Clow 543.529
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:
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Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price

BID SUMMARY

Product Offered Product Offered Product Offered

102 36" Hydrant Bury 6 EA Brand: Clow 925.00 Brand: Clow 1,054.00 Brand: Clow 991.765
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:

103 48" Hydrant Bury 6 EA Brand: Clow 1,210.00 Brand: Clow 1,376.00 Brand: Clow 1,295.294
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:

104 4" Hydrant Cast Iron Breakaway Spools 12 EA Brand: SBF 125.00 Brand: Sigma 182.00 Brand: Clow 140.596
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

105 6" Hydrant Cast Iron Breakaway Spools 12 EA Brand: SBF 136.00 Brand: Sigma 159.10 Brand: Clow 149.584
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

106 8" Hydrant Cast Iron Breakaway Spools 12 EA Brand: SBF 142.00 Brand: Sigma 164.40 Brand: Clow 174.104
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

107 12" Hydrant Cast Iron Breakaway Spools 12 EA Brand: SBF 163.00 Brand: Sigma 187.00 Brand: Clow 175.742
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

108 24" Hydrant Cast Iron Breakaway Spools 12 EA Brand: SBF 235.00 Brand: Sigma 280.90 Brand: Clow 264.020
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

109 36" Hydrant Bury 6 EA Brand: SBF 495.00 Brand: Sigma 423.90 Brand: Clow 416.174
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

110 48" Hydrant Bury 6 EA Brand: SBF 585.00 Brand: Sigma 439.00 Brand: Clow 467.406
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

111 Hydrant Breakoff Bolt Set 5/8" x 3" 6 EA Brand: ITP 45.00 Brand: Industrial Threaded Products 25.00 Brand: Tripac 72.05
T-2000 Blue Tripac Product No: Product No: Product No:

112 Romac XR501 Extended Range Transition Coupling, 4 inch 4 EA Brand: Romac 280.00 Brand: Ford 189.00 Brand: Romac 352.584
Epoxy Coated SS Trim Product No: XR-501-SS-04 Product No: FC2W Coupling Product No:

113 Romac XR501 Extended Range Transition Coupling 6 inch 6 EA Brand: Romac 385.00 Brand: Ford 223.00 Brand: Romac 451.661
Epoxy Coated SS Trim Product No: XR-501-SS-06 Product No: FC2W Coupling Product No:

114 Romac XR501 Extended Range Transition Coupling 8 inch 6 EA Brand: Romac 457.00 Brand: Ford 269.00 Brand: Romac 527.233
Epoxy Coated SS Trim Product No: XR-501-SS-08 Product No: FC2W Coupling Product No:

115 Romac XR501 Extended Range Transition Coupling 10 inch 4 EA Brand: Romac 590.00 Brand: Ford 404.00 Brand: Romac 551.264
Epoxy Coated SS Trim Product No: XR-501-SS-10 Product No: FC2W Coupling Product No:

116 Romac XR501 Extended Range Transition Coupling 12 inch 12 EA Brand: Romac 690.00 Brand: Ford 457.00 Brand: Romac 642.831
Epoxy Coated SS Trim Product No: XR-501-SS-12 Product No: FC2W Coupling Product No:

117 Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150 , FLxFL, 4 inch 6 EA Brand: Mueller/Pratt 805.00 Brand: American AVK 1,040.00 Brand: Clow 1,345.652
Product No: Product No: S816 Product No: 4500

118 Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150, FLxFL 6 inch 6 EA Brand: Mueller/Pratt 899.00 Brand: American AVK 1,069.00 Brand: Clow 1,395.652
Product No: Product No: S816 Product No: 4500

119 Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150, FLxFL 8 inch 6 EA Brand: Mueller/Pratt 1,155.00 Brand: American AVK 1,369.00 Brand: Clow 1,719.565
Product No: Product No: S816 Product No: 4500

120 Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150, FLxFL 10 inch 6 EA Brand: Mueller/Pratt 1,590.00 Brand: American AVK 1,889.00 Brand: Clow 2,225.000
Product No: Product No: S816 Product No: 4500

121 Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150, FLxFL 12 inch 6 EA Brand: Mueller/Pratt 1,920.00 Brand: American AVK 2,260.00 Brand: Clow 2,529.348
Product No: Product No: S816 Product No: 4500

122 Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150, FLxFL 16 inch 6 EA Brand: Mueller/Pratt 3,750.00 Brand: Henry Pratt 3,720.00 Brand: Clow 4,350.000
Product No: Product No: Groundhog Product No: 4500

123 Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150, FLxFL 24 inch 6 EA Brand: Mueller/Pratt 7,780.00 Brand: Henry Pratt 7,795.00 Brand: Clow 8,092.391
Product No: Product No: Groundhog Product No: 4500

124 Mueller 300 3/4" meter valve, FIPxFIP/meter nut/MIP 24 EA Brand: Mueller/Pratt 95.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: AY 66.975
Product No: B20200/B24394 Product No: Product No: 5139-112

125 Mueller 300 1" meter valve, FIPxFIP/meter nut/MIP 24 EA Brand: Mueller/Pratt 165.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: AY 102.638
Product No: B20200/B24394 Product No: Product No: 5139-113

126 Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 4-inch X 1-inch CC 4 EA Brand: Romac 90.20 Brand: Ford 74.70 Brand: Romac 110.379
Product No: 202NS-480X1CC Product No: FCD-202 Saddle Product No: 286-048041

127 Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 4-inch X 2-inch CC 4 EA Brand: Romac 104.00 Brand: Ford 101.90 Brand: Romac 120.192
Product No: 202NS-480X2CC Product No: FCD-202 Saddle Product No: 286-048071

128 Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 6-inch X 1-inch CC 6 EA Brand: Romac 105.00 Brand: Ford 85.80 Brand: Romac 126.805
Product No: 202NS-690X1CC Product No: FCD-202 Saddle Product No: 286-069041

129 Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 6-inch X 2-inch CC 6 EA Brand: Romac 113.00 Brand: Ford 105.70 Brand: Romac 137.739
Product No: 202NS-690X2CC Product No: FCD-202 Saddle Product No: 286-069071

130 Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 8-inch X 1-inch CC 6 EA Brand: Romac 120.00 Brand: Ford 120.90 Brand: Romac 147.488
Product No: 202NS-905X1CC Product No: FCD-202 Saddle Product No: 286-090541

131 Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 8-inch X 2-inch CC 6 EA Brand: Romac 125.00 Brand: Ford 130.00 Brand: Romac 157.20
Product No: 202NS-905X2CC Product No: FCD-202 Saddle Product No: 286-090571

132 Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 10-inch X 1-inch CC 5 EA Brand: Romac 146.00 Brand: Ford 144.30 Brand: Romac 178.091
Product No: 202NS-1110X1CC Product No: FCD-202 Saddle Product No: 286-111041

133 Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 10-inch X 2-inch CC 5 EA Brand: Romac 158.00 Brand: Ford 152.40 Brand: Romac 191.952
Product No: 202NS-1110X2CC Product No: FCD-202 Saddle Product No: 286-111071

134 Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 12-inch X 1-inch CC 6 EA Brand: Romac 170.00 Brand: Ford 164.30 Brand: Romac 207.301
Product No: 202NS-1320X1CC Product No: FCD-202 Saddle Product No: 286-132041

135 Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 12-inch X 2-inch CC 6 EA Brand: Romac 182.00 Brand: Ford 167.00 Brand: Romac 222.016
Product No: 202NS-1320X2CC Product No: FCD-202 Saddle Product No: 286-132071
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Invitation for Bids No. F24-013
Pipe and Miscellaneous Pipe Supplies

Vendor Name Core and Main Ferguson Ungerground Republic Water Works 
Address 3486 Investment Blvd 27750 Industrial Blvd 1175 Campbell Ave

Hayward, CA 94545 Hayward, CA 94545 San Jose, CA 95126
Contact Scott Silverthom Shane Stowe Jake Perez
Bid    
Item 
No.

Bid Description
Estimated  

Annual  
Usage

Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price

BID SUMMARY

Product Offered Product Offered Product Offered

136 .75" Type K copper, 100 feet/roll 6 RL Brand: Cambridge 700.00 Brand: Mueller Streamline 650.00 Brand: Cambridge Lee 730.00
Product No: Product No: Product No:

137 1" Type K copper, 100 feet/roll 3 RL Brand: Cambridge 875.00 Brand: Mueller Streamline 860.00 Brand: Cambridge Lee 971.00
Product No: Product No: Product No:

138 1.5" Type K copper, 100 feet/roll 2 RL Brand: Cambridge 1,300.00 Brand: Mueller Streamline 1,380.00 Brand: Cambridge Lee 930.00
Product No: Product No: Product No:

139 1.25" Type K copper, 100 feet/roll 1 RL Brand: Cambridge 1,060.00 Brand: Mueller Streamline 1,065.00 Brand: Cambridge Lee 720.00
Product No: Product No: Product No:

140 2" Type K copper, 100 feet/roll 1 RL Brand: Cambridge 2,200.00 Brand: Mueller Streamline 2,150.00 Brand: Cambridge Lee 1,440.00
Product No: Product No: Product No:

141 Pipe joint lube 24 EA Brand: Vinyltech 5.00 Brand: Pro Select 5.00 Brand: Ease-On 6.50
Product No: Product No: PSLUBXL1Q Product No:

142 Blue insulated tracer wire, 10 ga 4 RL Brand: 325.00 Brand: Southwire Co 200.00 Brand: Regency Wire 235.00
Product No: 10 AWG-Blue Product No: PE45 Blue 10GA Wire Product No:

143 Blue non-metallic "Water Line Buried Below" warning tape, 4 RL Brand: Calpico 60.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: Northtown 50.00
  6" x 1000' Product No: DWT-6 Product No: Product No:

144 10 Mil tape 100 RL Brand: Calpico 8.00 Brand: Pro Select 5.00 Brand: Northtown 8.00
Product No: VPC-10 Product No: Product No:

145 Fire hydrant, Clow Model 865 5 EA Brand: Clow 3,260.00 Brand: Clow 3,850.00 Brand: Clow 3,854.812
Product No: 865-4 1/2 Product No: Product No:

146 3" Adapter flange, AC to DIP, MJxFL 10 EA Brand: Tyler 112.00 Brand: Tyler 64.40 Brand: EBAA 83.129
Product No: 395508 Product No: Product No: 865

147 4" Adapter flange, AC to DIP, MJxFL 10 EA Brand: Tyler 112.00 Brand: Tyler 73.80 Brand: EBAA 132.12
Product No: 395515 Product No: Product No: 2103

148 6" Adapter flange, AC to DIP, MJxFL 10 EA Brand: Tyler 345.00 Brand: Tyler 101.30 Brand: EBAA 202.662
Product No: 395522 Product No: Product No: 2104

149 8" Adapter flange, AC to DIP, MJxFL 10 EA Brand: Tyler 490.00 Brand: Tyler 152.20 Brand: EBAA 309.277
Product No: 397588 Product No: Product No: 2106

150 4" Epoxy coated tee, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 40 EA Brand: Tyler 195.00 Brand: Tyler 164.40 Brand: EBAA 328.00
Domestic Product No: 395621 Product No: Product No: 2108

151 6" Epoxy coated tee, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 40 EA Brand: Tyler 329.00 Brand: Tyler 283.00 Brand: Tyler 596.00
Domestic Product No: 397595 Product No: Product No:

152 8"  Epoxy coated tee, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 40 EA Brand: Tyler 535.00 Brand: Tyler 417.00 Brand: Tyler 1,132.00
Domestic Product No: 397403 Product No: Product No:

153 10" Epoxy coated tee, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 40 EA Brand: Tyler 760.00 Brand: Tyler 689.00 Brand: Tyler 1,784.00
Domestic Product No: 397984 Product No: Product No:

154 12" Epoxy coated tee, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 40 EA Brand: Tyler 1,015.00 Brand: Tyler 891.00 Brand: Tyler 2,484.00
Domestic Product No: 698029 Product No: Product No:

155 16" Epoxy coated tee, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 40 EA Brand: Tyler 2,612.00 Brand: Tyler 2,260.00 Brand: Tyler 6,086.00
Domestic Product No: 084839 Product No: Product No:

156 4" Epoxy coated Reducer, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 10 EA Brand: Tyler 280.00 Brand: Tyler 120.30 Brand: Tyler 268.00
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:

157 6" Epoxy coated Reducer, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 10 EA Brand: Tyler 362.00 Brand: Tyler 120.30 Brand: Tyler 434.00
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:

158 8" Epoxy coated Reducer, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 10 EA Brand: Tyler 495.00 Brand: Tyler 197.00 Brand: Tyler 578.00
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:

159 10" Epoxy coated Reducer, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 10 EA Brand: Tyler 820.00 Brand: Tyler 279.00 Brand: Tyler 781.00
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:

160 12" Epoxy coated Reducer, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 10 EA Brand: Tyler 1,120.00 Brand: Tyler 430.00 Brand: Tyler 1,198.00
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:

161 16" Epoxy coated Reducer, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 10 EA Brand: Tyler 2,760.00 Brand: Tyler 922.00 Brand: Tyler 1,931.00
Domestic Product No: Product No: Product No:

162 4" Ductile iron pipe, Class 52 8 EA Brand: US Pipe 702.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: McWane 36.234
Domestic Product No: CL52-TJ04 Product No: Product No:

163 6" Ductile iron pipe, Class 52 8 EA Brand: US Pipe 540.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: McWane 27.854
Domestic Product No: CL52-TJ06 Product No: Product No:

164 8" Ductile iron pipe, Class 52 8 EA Brand: US Pipe 774.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: McWane 39.308
Domestic Product No: CL52-TJ08 Product No: Product No:

165 10" Ductile iron pipe, Class 52 8 EA Brand: US Pipe 990.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: McWane 51.518
Domestic Product No: CL52-TJ10 Product No: Product No:

166 12" Ductile iron pipe, Class 52 8 EA Brand: US Pipe 1,260.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: McWane 64.876
Domestic Product No: CL52-TJ12 Product No: Product No:

167 16" Ductile iron pipe, Class 52 8 EA Brand: US Pipe 1,836.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: McWane 93.867
Domestic Product No: CL52-TJ16 Product No: Product No:

168 4" Epoxy coated tee, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 40 EA Brand: Sigma 174.00 Brand: Tyler 133.00 Brand: Tyler 335.000
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

169 6" Epoxy coated tee, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 40 EA Brand: Tyler 294.00 Brand: Tyler 213.60 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

170 8"  Epoxy coated tee, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 40 EA Brand: Tyler 433.00 Brand: Tyler 320.20 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:
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Invitation for Bids No. F24-013
Pipe and Miscellaneous Pipe Supplies

Vendor Name Core and Main Ferguson Ungerground Republic Water Works 
Address 3486 Investment Blvd 27750 Industrial Blvd 1175 Campbell Ave

Hayward, CA 94545 Hayward, CA 94545 San Jose, CA 95126
Contact Scott Silverthom Shane Stowe Jake Perez
Bid    
Item 
No.

Bid Description
Estimated  

Annual  
Usage

Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price

BID SUMMARY

Product Offered Product Offered Product Offered

171 10" Epoxy coated tee, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 40 EA Brand: Tyler 755.00 Brand: Tyler 452.70 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

172 12" Epoxy coated tee, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 40 EA Brand: Tyler 995.00 Brand: Tyler 631.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

173 16" Epoxy coated tee, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 40 EA Brand: Tyler 2,360.00 Brand: Tyler 1,440.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

174 4" Epoxy coated Reducer, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 10 EA Brand: Tyler 92.00 Brand: Tyler 89.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

175 6" Epoxy coated Reducer, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 10 EA Brand: Tyler 98.00 Brand: Tyler 98.90 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

176 8" Epoxy coated Reducer, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 10 EA Brand: Tyler 138.00 Brand: Tyler 133.10 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

178 10" Epoxy coated Reducer, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 10 EA Brand: Tyler 210.00 Brand: Tyler 203.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

179 12" Epoxy coated Reducer, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 10 EA Brand: Tyler 283.00 Brand: Tyler 272.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

180 16" Epoxy coated Reducer, MJ, MJxFLG, FLG 10 EA Brand: Tyler 745.00 Brand: Tyler 517.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

181 4" Ductile iron pipe, Class 52 8 EA Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

182 6" Ductile iron pipe, Class 52 8 EA Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

183 8" Ductile iron pipe, Class 52 8 EA Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

184 10" Ductile iron pipe, Class 52 8 EA Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

185 12" Ductile iron pipe, Class 52 8 EA Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

186 16" Ductile iron pipe, Class 52 8 EA Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Product No:

187 4" C900 DR14 plastic pipe 12 EA Brand: NAPCO 176.00 Brand: Westlake Pipe 8.60/ft Brand: No Bid No Bid
Product No: YDR14 Product No: Product No:

188 6" C900 DR14 plastic pipe 12 EA Brand: NAPCO 344.00 Brand: Westlake Pipe 17.30/ft Brand: No Bid No Bid
Product No: 6DR14 Product No: Product No:

189 8" C900 DR14 plastic pipe 12 EA Brand: NAPCO 592.00 Brand: Westlake Pipe 29.90/ft Brand: No Bid No Bid
Product No: 8DR14 Product No: Product No:

190 10" C900 DR14 plastic pipe 12 EA Brand: NAPCO 916.00 Brand: Westlake Pipe 45.50/ft Brand: No Bid No Bid
Product No: 10RR14 Product No: Product No:

191 12" C900 DR14 plastic pipe 12 EA Brand: NAPCO 1,290.00 Brand: Westlake Pipe 64.30/ft Brand: Vinyltech 58.804
Product No: 12DR14 Product No: Product No:

192 16" C900 DR14 plastic pipe 12 EA Brand: NAPCO 2,400.00 Brand: Westlake Pipe 96.60/ft Brand: Vinyltech 113.674
Product No: 16DR14 Product No: Product No:

193 Mueller D5 and CL12 tapping machine rebuild kit, shell cutters, 25 EA Brand: Mueller 1,620.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: Mueller list
and drill bits

194 Enclosures: 2" backflow,hunter green 5 EA Brand: Guardshack 520.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: Guardshack 550.51
Guardshack Product No: GS-2 Product No: Product No:

195 Enclosures: Sample Station,hunter green 5 EA Brand: Pipeline Products 600.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: Guardshack 550.51
Pipeline Products Product No: Product No: Product No:

196 Enclosures: ARV hunter green, 5 EA Brand: Pipeline Products 440.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: Guardshack 550.51
Pipeline Products Product No: Product No: Product No:

197 3/4" IP/CC plug 10 EA Brand: Ford 17.00 Brand: Merit Brass 2.80 Brand: AY 11.835
Product No: CSP-3-NL Product No: Product No: 5126-102

198 1" IP/CC plug 10 EA Brand: Ford 20.00 Brand: Merit Brass 3.70 Brand: AY 17.207
Product No: CSP-4-NL Product No: Product No: 5126-103

199 1.5" IP/CC plug 10 EA Brand: Ford 43.00 Brand: Merit Brass 7.00 Brand: AY 38.593
Product No: CSP-6-NL Product No: Product No: 5126-105

200 2" IP/CC plug 10 EA Brand: Ford 74.40 Brand: Merit Brass 11.10 Brand: AY 50.039
Product No: CSP-7-NL Product No: Product No: 5126-106

201 3" PE x Flange, 24" long 10 EA Brand: Custom Pipe 510.00 Brand: Custom Pipe & Coupling 592.00 Brand: Aqueous 456.824
Domestic Product No: Product No: Domestic Product No:

202 4" PE x Flange, 24" long 10 EA Brand: Custom Pipe 420.00 Brand: Custom Pipe & Coupling 354.00 Brand: Aqueous 228.776
Domestic Product No: Product No: Domestic Product No:

203 6" PE x Flange, 24" long 10 EA Brand: Custom Pipe 515.00 Brand: Custom Pipe & Coupling 445.00 Brand: Aqueous 280.165
Domestic Product No: Product No: Domestic Product No:

204 8" PE x Flange, 24" long 10 EA Brand: Custom Pipe 765.00 Brand: Custom Pipe & Coupling 659.00 Brand: Aqueous 404.188
Domestic Product No: Product No: Domestic Product No:

205 10" PE x Flange, 24" long 10 EA Brand: Custom Pipe 998.00 Brand: Custom Pipe & Coupling 882.00 Brand: Aqueous 521.788
Domestic Product No: Product No: Domestic Product No:

206 12" PE x Flange, 24" long 10 EA Brand: Custom Pipe 1,320.00 Brand: Custom Pipe & Coupling 1,210.00 Brand: Aqueous 676.941
Domestic Product No: Product No: Domestic Product No:
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Invitation for Bids No. F24-013
Pipe and Miscellaneous Pipe Supplies

Vendor Name Core and Main Ferguson Ungerground Republic Water Works 
Address 3486 Investment Blvd 27750 Industrial Blvd 1175 Campbell Ave

Hayward, CA 94545 Hayward, CA 94545 San Jose, CA 95126
Contact Scott Silverthom Shane Stowe Jake Perez
Bid    
Item 
No.

Bid Description
Estimated  

Annual  
Usage

Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price

BID SUMMARY

Product Offered Product Offered Product Offered

207 MJ cap with 2-inch FIP port, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 89.00 Brand: Tyler Union 104.50 Brand: Tyler 98.941
 4" Domestic Product No: 3968738 Product No: Product No:

208 MJ cap with 2-inch FIP port, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 115.00 Brand: Tyler Union 151.00 Brand: Tyler 142.159
6" Domestic Product No: 398745 Product No: Product No:

209 MJ cap with 2-inch FIP port, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 158.00 Brand: Tyler Union 206.50 Brand: Tyler 194.312
8"  Domestic Product No: 398752 Product No: Product No:

210 MJ cap with 2-inch FIP port, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 220.00 Brand: Tyler Union 246.60 Brand: Tyler 232.165
10"  Domestic Product No: 401568 Product No: Product No:

211 MJ cap with 2-inch FIP port, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 270.00 Brand: Tyler Union 303.80 Brand: Tyler 286.000
12"  Domestic Product No: 398769 Product No: Product No:

212 MJ cap with 2-inch FIP port, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 673.00 Brand: Tyler Union 752.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
16" Domestic Product No: 109792 Product No: Product No:

213 4" MJ plug with 2-inch FIP, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 105.00 Brand: Tyler Union 123.40 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Domestic Product No: 398875 Product No: Product No:

214 6" MJ plug with 2-inch FIP, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 140.00 Brand: Tyler Union 165.30 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Domestic Product No: 398882 Product No: Product No:

215 8" MJ plug with 2-inch FIP, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 195.00 Brand: Tyler Union 221.60 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Domestic Product No: 398899 Product No: Product No:

216 10" MJ plug with 2-inch FIP, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 230.00 Brand: Tyler Union 269.90 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Domestic Product No: 401551 Product No: Product No:

217 12" MJ plug with 2-inch FIP, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 353.00 Brand: Tyler Union 412.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Domestic Product No: 107132 Product No: Product No:

218 16" MJ plug with 2-inch FIP, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 860.00 Brand: Tyler Union 1,004.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Domestic Product No: 402459 Product No: Product No:

219 3" PE x Flange, 24" long 10 EA Brand: Custom Pipe 320.00 Brand: Custom Pipe & Coupling 511.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Imports Product No:

220 4" PE x Flange, 24" long 10 EA Brand: Custom Pipe 215.00 Brand: Custom Pipe & Coupling 261.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Imports Product No:

221 6" PE x Flange, 24" long 10 EA Brand: Custom Pipe 250.00 Brand: Custom Pipe & Coupling 320.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Imports Product No:

222 8" PE x Flange, 24" long 10 EA Brand: Custom Pipe 370.00 Brand: Custom Pipe & Coupling 461.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Imports Product No:

223 10" PE x Flange, 24" long 10 EA Brand: Custom Pipe 490.00 Brand: Custom Pipe & Coupling 595.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Imports Product No:

224 12" PE x Flange, 24" long 10 EA Brand: Custom Pipe 660.00 Brand: Custom Pipe & Coupling 773.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: Product No: Imports Product No:

225 MJ cap with 2-inch FIP port, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 74.00 Brand: Tyler Union 76.80 Brand: No Bid No Bid
 4" Import Product No: 030775 Product No: Product No:

226 MJ cap with 2-inch FIP port, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 98.00 Brand: Tyler Union 109.50 Brand: No Bid No Bid
6" Import Product No: 030782 Product No: Product No:

227 MJ cap with 2-inch FIP port, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 132.00 Brand: Tyler Union 137.40 Brand: No Bid No Bid
8"  Import Product No: 030799 Product No: Product No:

228 MJ cap with 2-inch FIP port, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 178.00 Brand: Tyler Union 184.60 Brand: No Bid No Bid
10"  Import Product No: 030744 Product No: Product No:

229 MJ cap with 2-inch FIP port, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 245.00 Brand: Tyler Union 251.10 Brand: No Bid No Bid
12"  Import Product No: 030751 Product No: Product No:

230 MJ cap with 2-inch FIP port, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 476.00 Brand: Tyler Union 494.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid
16" Import Product No: 033042 Product No: Product No:

231 4" MJ plug with 2-inch FIP, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 80.00 Brand: Tyler Union 84.80 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: 031208 Product No: Product No:

232 6" MJ plug with 2-inch FIP, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 120.00 Brand: Tyler Union 127.20 Brand: No Bid No Bid
Import Product No: 031222 Product No: Product No:

233 8" MJ plug with 2-inch FIP, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 156.00 Brand: Tyler Union 171.00 Brand: Tyler 164.094
Import Product No: 031246 Product No: Product No:

234 10" MJ plug with 2-inch FIP, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 245.00 Brand: Tyler Union 269.00 Brand: Tyler 258.824
Import Product No: 031161 Product No: Product No:

235 12" MJ plug with 2-inch FIP, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 250.00 Brand: Tyler Union 272.00 Brand: Tyler 262.447
Import Product No: 031178 Product No: Product No:

236 16" MJ plug with 2-inch FIP, epoxy coated 5 EA Brand: Tyler 640.00 Brand: Tyler Union 667.00 Brand: Tyler 642.918
Import Product No: 033226 Product No: Product No:

237 Pamrex Storm MH lid and frame (STORM) 80 EA Brand: Pamrex 560.00 Brand: Pamrex 481.00 Brand: Pamrex 390.526
Product No: Product No: MH lid & frame Product No:

238 Rexus Sewer MH lid and frame  (SEWER) 80 EA Brand: Rexus 560.00 Brand: Pamrex 380.00 Brand: Pamrex 285.263
Product No: Rexus-2 Product No: MH lid & frame Product No:

239 4" SDR 26 pipe (SEWER) 200 FT Brand: NAPCO 3.67 Brand: Westlake Pipe 4.00 Brand: Vinyltech 3.295
Product No: Product No: Product No:

240 6" SDR 26 pipe (SEWER) 200 FT Brand: NAPCO 8.20 Brand: Westlake Pipe 9.00 Brand: Vinyltech 7.879
Product No: Product No: Product No:

241 8" SDR 26 pipe (SEWER) 200 FT Brand: NAPCO 14.95 Brand: Westlake Pipe 16.20 Brand: Vinyltech 13.358
Product No: Product No: Product No:
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Invitation for Bids No. F24-013
Pipe and Miscellaneous Pipe Supplies

Vendor Name Core and Main Ferguson Ungerground Republic Water Works 
Address 3486 Investment Blvd 27750 Industrial Blvd 1175 Campbell Ave

Hayward, CA 94545 Hayward, CA 94545 San Jose, CA 95126
Contact Scott Silverthom Shane Stowe Jake Perez
Bid    
Item 
No.

Bid Description
Estimated  

Annual  
Usage

Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price

BID SUMMARY

Product Offered Product Offered Product Offered

242 10" SDR 26 pipe (SEWER) 200 FT Brand: NAPCO 23.20 Brand: Westlake Pipe 25.20 Brand: Vinyltech 20.789
Product No: Product No: Product No:

243 12" SDR 26 pipe (SEWER) 200 FT Brand: NAPCO 33.40 Brand: Westlake Pipe 36.30 Brand: Vinyltech 29.884
Product No: Product No: Product No:

244 Man hole barrel (Piranah & Old Castle)  (SEWER) 12 EA Brand: Old Castle 1,200.00 Brand: No Bid No Bid Brand: Piranah list
Product No: Product No: Product No:

245 4" Mission Bands Repair clamps (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: Mission 55.00 Brand: Fernco 25.20 Brand: Mission 46.852
Product No: MR56-ARC Product No: 5056 RC Series Product No:

246 6" Mission Bands Repair clamps (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: Mission 115.00 Brand: Fernco 47.90 Brand: Mission 93.041
Product No: MR56-ARC Product No: 5056 RC Series Product No:

247 8" Mission Bands Repair clamps (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: Mission 135.00 Brand: Fernco 71.00 Brand: Mission 118.278
Product No: MR56-ARC Product No: 5056 RC Series Product No:

248 10" Mission Bands Repair clamps (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: Mission 185.00 Brand: Fernco 92.40 Brand: Mission 145.146
Product No: MR56-ARC Product No: 5056 RC Series Product No:

249 12" Mission Bands Repair clamps (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: Mission 196.00 Brand: Fernco 113.00 Brand: Mission 203.558
Product No: MR56-ARC Product No: 5056 RC Series Product No:

250 4" Max Adapters (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: Max Adapter 70.00 Brand: Maxadaptor 69.30 Brand: Maxadaptor 62.32
Product No: Max4 Product No: Product No:

251 6" Max Adapters (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: Max Adapter 99.00 Brand: Maxadaptor 103.20 Brand: Maxadaptor 92.827
Product No: Max6 Product No: Product No:

252 8" Max Adapters (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: Max Adapter 132.00 Brand: Maxadaptor 136.00 Brand: Maxadaptor 122.32
Product No: Max8 Product No: Product No:

253 10" Max Adapters (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: Max Adapter 165.00 Brand: Maxadaptor 170.00 Brand: Maxadaptor 152.847
Product No: Max10 Product No: Product No:

254 12" Max Adapters (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: Max Adapter 198.00 Brand: Maxadaptor 203.80 Brand: Maxadaptor 183.36
Product No: Max12 Product No: Product No:

255 4" SDR 26 Fittings T's Y's plugs (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: NAPCO 95.00 Brand: Multifittings 21.10 Brand: GPK 58.19
Product No: Product No: plugs Product No:

256 6" SDR 26 Fittings T's Y's plugs (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: NAPCO 150.00 Brand: Multifittings 42.50 Brand: GPK 94.465
Product No: Product No: plugs Product No:

257 8" SDR 26 Fittings T's Y's plugs (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: NAPCO 340.00 Brand: Multifittings 75.10 Brand: GPK 215.177
Product No: Product No: plugs Product No:

258 10" SDR 26 Fittings T's Y's plugs  (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: NAPCO 1,920.00 Brand: Multifittings 144.30 Brand: GPK 513.233
Product No: Product No: plugs Product No:

259 12" SDR 26 Fittings T's Y's plugs  (SEWER) 100 EA Brand: NAPCO 2,600.00 Brand: Multifittings 172.00 Brand: GPK 727.13
Product No: Product No: plugs Product No:

260 10" Megalug EBAA Series 1100 for DI & C900 20 EA Brand: EBAA 200.00 Brand: EBAA 184.00 Brand: EBAA 169.37
w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: 110/2010PSC Product No: 110DECEY Product No: 1110DECEY

261 12" Megalug EBAA Series 1100 for DI & C900 25 EA Brand: EBAA 205.00 Brand: EBAA 259.00 Brand: EBAA 238.978
w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: 1112/2012PSC Product No: 1112DECEY Product No: 1112DECET

262 4" Tyler Union TDW Tuff Grip Restraint 24 EA Brand: Tyler 73.00 Brand: Tyler 54.10 Brand: Tyler 55.84
w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: TUFF-DW-B-4 Product No: DW Tufgrip w/blue Product No:

263 6" Tyler Union TDW Tuff Grip Restraint 48 EA Brand: Tyler 96.00 Brand: Tyler 69.40 Brand: Tyler 73.846
w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: TUFF-DW-B-6 Product No: DW Tufgrip w/blue Product No:

264 8" Tyler Union TDW Tuff Grip Restraint 48 EA Brand: Tyler 124.00 Brand: Tyler 92.30 Brand: Tyler 92.295
w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: TUFF-DW-B-8 Product No: DW Tufgrip w/blue Product No:

265 10" Tyler Union TDW Tuff Grip Restraint 36 EA Brand: Tyler 195.00 Brand: Tyler 157.70 Brand: Tyler 129.014
w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: TUFF-DW-B-10 Product No: DW Tufgrip w/blue Product No:

266 12" Tyler Union TDW Tuff Grip Restraint 48 EA Brand: Tyler 210.00 Brand: Tyler 166.70 Brand: Tyler 136.583
w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: TUFF-DW-B-12 Product No: DW Tufgrip w/blue Product No:

267 16" Tyler Union TDW Tuff Grip Restraint 12 EA Brand: Tyler 415.00 Brand: Tyler 377.30 Brand: Tyler 315.011
w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: TUFF-DW-B-16 Product No: DW Tufgrip w/blue Product No:

268 4" Hymax 2 Coupling - Regular OD 4.25-5.63 6 EA Brand: Hymax 240.00 Brand: Hymax 258.00 Brand: Hymax 238.571
Product No: 860-54-0108-16 Product No: Product No:

269 4" Hymax 2 Coupling - Long OD 4.25-5.63 6 EA Brand: Hymax 384.00 Brand: Hymax 424.00 Brand: Hymax 373.364
Product No: 862-54-0163-16 Product No: Product No:

270 6" Hymax 2 Coupling - Regular OD 6.42-7.68 6 EA Brand: Hymax 310.00 Brand: Hymax 341.70 Brand: Hymax 315.951
Product No: 860-54-0163-16 Product No: Product No:

271 6" Hymax 2 Coupling - Long OD 6.42-7.68 20 EA Brand: Hymax 510.00 Brand: Hymax 565.00 Brand: Hymax 497.484
Product No: 862-54-0163-16 Product No: Product No:

272 8" Hymax 2 Coupling - Regular OD 8.54-9.84 20 EA Brand: Hymax 343.00 Brand: Hymax 385.80 Brand: Hymax 356.723
Product No: 860-54-0217-16 Product No: Product No:

273 8" Hymax 2 Coupling - Long OD 8.54-9.84 20 EA Brand: Hymax 562.00 Brand: Hymax 631.70 Brand: Hymax 556.217
Product No: 862-54-0217-16 Product No: Product No:

274 10" Hymax 2 Coupling - Regular OD 10-.70-12.00 20 EA Brand: Hymax 475.00 Brand: Hymax 496.00 Brand: Hymax 485.212
Product No: 860-54-0278-16 Product No: Product No:

275 10" Hymax 2 Coupling - Long OD 10-.70-12.00 30 EA Brand: Hymax 729.00 Brand: Hymax 768.00 Brand: Hymax 676.228
Product No: 862-54-0278-16 Product No: Product No:

276 12" Hymax 2 Coupling - Regular OD 13.15-14.41 20 EA Brand: Hymax 635.00 Brand: Hymax 701.00 Brand: Hymax 648.00
Product No: 860-54-0334-16 Product No: Product No:
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Invitation for Bids No. F24-013
Pipe and Miscellaneous Pipe Supplies

Vendor Name Core and Main Ferguson Ungerground Republic Water Works 
Address 3486 Investment Blvd 27750 Industrial Blvd 1175 Campbell Ave

Hayward, CA 94545 Hayward, CA 94545 San Jose, CA 95126
Contact Scott Silverthom Shane Stowe Jake Perez
Bid    
Item 
No.

Bid Description
Estimated  

Annual  
Usage

Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price

BID SUMMARY

Product Offered Product Offered Product Offered

277 12" Hymax 2 Coupling - Long OD 13.15-14.41 20 EA Brand: Hymax 845.00 Brand: Hymax 951.00 Brand: Hymax 837.576
Product No: 862-54-0334-16 Product No: Product No:

278 3" Hymax Grip Flange Adapter 10 EA Brand: Hymax 300.00 Brand: Hymax 338.00 Brand: Hymax 237.211
Product No: 134-96-03080-16 Product No: Product No:

279 4" Hymax Grip Flange Adapter 10 EA Brand: Hymax 316.00 Brand: Hymax 356.00 Brand: Hymax 303.311
Product No: 134-996-04111-16 Product No: Product No:

280 6" Hymax Grip Flange Adapter 10 EA Brand: Hymax 325.00 Brand: Hymax 366.00 Brand: Hymax 311.911
Product No: 134-96-06165-16 Product No: Product No:

* The City has determined some bid items offered do not meet the standard of quality, performance or use desired due to compatibility, size, lay length and coating type.
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