
City of Sunnyvale, California
IFB No. F16-46
SIX (6) Service Trucks
Bid Tabulation

Bidder Frontier Ford Towne Ford Sales Oroville Ford
Address 3701 Stevens Creek Blvd 1601 El Camino Real 1350 Oro Dam Blvd.

Santa Clara, CA 95051-7396 Redwood City, CA 94063 Oroville, CA 95965
Contact Virginia Harper Lloyd Pratt Chris Goodhue

Item Pricing Qty Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount
1 1 ton extended cab with service body (unit 632) 1 56,200.00 56,200.00 64,040.14 64,040.14 50,485.96 50,485.96

   Make/Model/Year
2016 Ford F350 Chassis - 

F3G 2016 Ford F350
2016 Ford F350 Supercab, 

Body
2 1-1/2 ton regular cab stake truck, 2WD DRW (unit 701) 1 46,600.00 46,600.00 52,527.80 52,527.80

   Make/Model/Year
2016 Ford F450 Chassis - 

F4G 2016 Ford F550 NO BID NO BID
3 5-6 cubic yard dump truck 2WD DRW (unit 715) 1

   Make/Model/Year NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 Cargo minivan, Transit Connect XL or equal (unit 691) 1 20,700.00 20,700.00 22,432.29 22,432.29 20,337.39 20,337.39

   Make/Model/Year
2016 Ford Transit Connect - 

S7E 2016 Ford Transit Connect 2016 Transit Connect
5 Cargo van, full size, equal to Ford Transit (unit 471) 1 21,700.00 21,700.00 23,489.06 23,489.06 22,135.13 22,135.13

   Make/Model/Year 2016 Ford Transit - E1C 2016 Ford Transit 2016 Ford Transit
6 3/4 ton regular cab chassis (with refurbished City provided 1 38,900.00 38,900.00 47,222.47 47,222.47 31,887.22 31,887.22

 flatbed) 2WD SRW (unit 617)
   Make/Model/Year 2016 Ford F250 - F2A 2016 Ford F350 2016 Ford F250

7 Tire Fee/Qty 29@1.75 50.75 31@1.75 54.25 22@1.75 38.50

Prompt Payment Terms Net 30 days Net 30 days Net 30 days
Delivery 150-220 days 180 days 90 days

ATTACHMENT 1




