Attachment 1

03/06/2018
City of Sunnyvale, California
Invitation for Bids No. F18-183
Water Meters

Bid Summary
Vendor National Meter & Automation, Inc. (Badger) Mueller Systems Zenner USA
Address 2250 Apollo Wy. #300 10210 Statesville Blvd. 15280 Addison Rd., Suite 340
Santa Rosa, CA 95407 Cleveland, NC 27013 Addison, TX 75001
Phone 707-575-0700 704-278-2221 972-386-6611 x125
Contact Brian Helphand K. Anita Short Bernard Nance
Bid Item|Description Qty | Unit] Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Item A. [positive Displacement Multi-Jet Water Meters with
Encoder-type Register and In-line Connector Without ERT With ERT Without ERT Without ERT With ERT
Al 5/8" X i 1000 | EA 91.31]  91,310.00 161.91| 161,910.00 75.00 75,000.00 60.65|  60,650.00( NO BID
Badger M25 HRE Hersey 420 Bronze Zenner PMNO2
A2. ¥ 300 | EA 110.77| 33,231.00 181.37| 54,411.00 92.00| 27,600.00 64.37| 19,311.00f NOBID
Badger M35 HRE Hersey 435 Bronze Zenner PMNO3
A3. 1 200 | SET 138.20| 27,640.00 208.80| 41,760.00 127.00| 25,400.00 88.15| 17,630.00[ NOBID
Badger M55 HRE Hersey 452 Zenner PMNO7
A4. 17 200 | EA 272.36| 54,472.00 342.96| 68,592.00 260.00| 52,000.00 211.06| 42,212.00] NO BID
Badger M120 HRE Hersey 562 Zenner PMNO9
Ab. 2" 200 | EA 378.77| 75,754.00 449.37| 89,874.00 340.00| 68,000.00 260.66| 52,132.00) NO BID
Badger M170 HRE Hersey 572 Zenner PMN12
SUBTOTAL ITEM A 282,407.00 416,547.00) | 248,000.00| 191,935.00
Item B. [Class Il Turbine Water Meters with Strainers,
Encoder-type Register and In-line Connector
B1. 17 20 | EA 621.31| 12,426.20 691.91| 13,838.20 346.50 | 6,930.00 394.99 7,899.80| NOBID
Badger T160 HRE Alternative: Hersey MVR 100 Zenner PMTBO1
B2. 2" 20 | EA 705.50| 14,110.00 776.10| 15,522.00] 429.30 8,586.00 421.22| 8,424.40) NO BID
Badger T200 HRE Alternative: Hersey MVR 160 Zenner PMTB02
B3. 3" 10 | EA 801.60| 8,016.00 872.20| 8,722.00 787.05 7,870.50 865.98| 8,659.80] NO BID
Badger T450 HRE Alternative: Hersey MVR 350 Zenner PMTB03
B4. 4 10 | EA 1,162.64| 11,626.40 1,233.24| 12,332.40 1,069.65 | 10,696.50 1,085.03| 10,850.30[ NOBID
Badger T1000 HRE Alternative: Hersey MVR 650 Zenner PMTB04
B5. 6" 5 EA 3|782.00| 18,910.00 3,852.60| 19,263.00 2,162.70 10,813.50 1,917.65| 9,588.25| NO BID
Badger T2000 HRE Alternative: Hersey MVR 1300 Zenner PMTB06
B6. 8" 5 | EA 5.480.33| 27,401.65 5|550.93| 27,754.65 NO BID 3,258.81| 16,294.05| NO BID
Badger T3500 HRE Zenner PMTBO8
SUBTOTAL ITEM B 92,490.25 97,432.25 44,896.50 61,716.60
Item C. |Compound Meter with Strainer, Encoder-type
Register and In-line Connector
Cl1. 3" 5 EA 2,885.50 14,427.50 3,026.70 15,133.50) NO BID 1,878.42 9,392.10 NO BID
Badger CSM 3" HRE Zenner PMCBO03
c2. 4 5 | EA 3,857.26]  19,286.30 3,998.46|  19,992.30 NO BID 2,408.32| 12,041.60| NO BID
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Badger CSM 4" HRE Zenner PMCB04
C3. 6" 2 EA 5,294.30 10,588.60 5,435.50 10,871.00] NO BID 4,324.26 8,648.52 NO BID
Badger CSM 6" HRE Zenner PMCB06
SUBTOTAL ITEM C 44,302.40 45,996.80 NO BID 30,082.22| NOBID
Item D. [Combo Meter with Test Port
D1. 8" 4 EA 5,184.75 20,739.00 5,325.95 21,303.80 NO BID 4,704.29 18,817.16 NO BID
Badger Combo 8" HRE Zenner PMC08
SUBTOTAL ITEM D 20,739.00 21,303.80
Item E. |Reclaimed Water Meter, Disc and Turbo, Lavender
El. 19" 8 | EA 282.59 2,260.72 353.19 2,825.52 353.70 2,829.60) 211.06 1,688.48| NO BID
Badger M120 RC HRE Alternative: Hersey MVR 100 Reclaimed |Zenner PMNRO9
E2. 2" 8 EA 389.00| 3,112.00 459.60| 3,676.80 436.50 | 3,492.00 260.66| 2,085.28 NO BID
Badger M170 RC HRE Alternative: Hersey MVR 160 Reclaimed |Zenner PMNR12
E3. 3" 2 EA 734.08| 1,468.16 804.68| 1,609.36 NO BID | 865.98| 1,731.96 NO BID
Badger T450 RC HRE Zenner PMTBRO3
E4. 4" 2 EA 1,063.30| 2,126.60 1,133.90| 2,267.80] NO BID | 1,085.03| 2,170.06 NO BID
Badger T1000 RC HRE Zenner PMTBR0O4
ES. 6" 2 EA 2,500.15| 5,000.30 2,570.75| 5,141.50] NO BID | l,917.65| 3,835.30 NO BID
Badger T2000 RC HRE Zenner PMTBRO6
E6. 8" 2 EA 2,800.85| 5,601.70 2,871.45| 5,742.90] NO BID | 3,258.81| 6,517.62 NO BID
Badger T3500 RC HRE Zenner PMTBRO8
SUBTOTAL ITEM E 19,569.48 21,263.88 NO BID 6,321.60 18,028.70| NO BID
Item F. |Fire Hydrant Meter, without Backflow
F1. 3 10 | EA 715.17 7,151.70 785.77 7,857.70 575.00 5,750.00 350.06 3,500.60[ NO BID
Hersey Hydrant Meter (Direct Read
Badger Fire Hydrant Meter 3" HRE Register Only) Zenner FHZ20
SUBTOTAL ITEM F | 7,151.70 7,857.70 | | 3,500.60
Miscellaneous items, discount from list price:
Repair parts for meters N/A 25% 40%
Meter accessories 13% 250 40%
Test equipment N/A N/A 40%
Other meter sizes N/A N/A 40%
Warranty replacements will be shipped within how many days? 21 days 10-20 days 14 days
Standard delivery time after receipt of order? 48 days 30 days ARO 20-25 days
Prompt payment terms offered Net 30 2% 30 Days, Net 31 Net 30

* Bid received from Mueller Systems for Meters with ERT deemed non-responsive. Bidder failed to meet specifications.
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