Bid

County of Santa Clara

ATTACHMENT 1

Bid #1TB-PRO-FY15-0139-REV-AUC-2 DIESEL - REVERSE AUCTION FOR FUEL

Creation Date Oct 6, 2014
Start Date Oct 28, 2014 9:26:39 AM PDT

(CARB ULSD #2)

End Date Oct 28, 2014 12:14:49 PM PDT
Awarded Date Not Yet Awarded

ITB-PRO-FY15-0139-REV-AUC-2 DIESEL--01-01 CARB ULSD #2 - Lot 1 - up to 1,500 (for all agencies except

AC Transit)

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Golden Gate Petrolrum [Ad] | First Offer - $3.17 1/ gallon $3.17

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

VALLEY OIL COMPANY | |First Offer - $3.189 | 1/ gallon | $3.189 | |

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Southern Counties Oil Co. [Ad] || First Offer - $3.20 | 1/ gallon | $3.20 | |

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. || First Offer - $4.00 | 1/ gallon | $4.00 | |

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc is a Diversified,
Woman Owned Business Enterprise.

except AC Transit)

ITB-PRO-FY15-0139-REV-AUC-2 DIESEL--01-02 CARB ULSD #2 - Lot 2 - 1,501 - 6,000 (for all agencies

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Golden Gate Petrolrum [Ad] |First Offer - $3.075 1/ gallon $3.075

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

VALLEY OIL COMPANY | [First Offer - $3.085 | 1/ gallon | $3.085 | |

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Southern Counties Oil Co. [Ad] | [First Offer - $3.085 | 1/ gallon | $3.085 | |

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. || First Offer - $3.20 | 1/ gallon | $3.20 | |

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc is a Diversified,
Woman Owned Business Enterprise.

except AC Transit Dist)

ITB-PRO-FY15-0139-REV-AUC-2 DIESEL--01-03 CARB ULSD #2 - Lot 3 - 6,001 - 10,000+ (for all agencies

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Mansfield Oil Company [Ad] |First Offer - $2.9996 1/ gallon $2.9996

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Golden Gate Petrolrum [Ad] | |First Offer - $3.0008 1/ gallon | $3.0008 | |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. | | First Offer - $3.002 | 1/ gallon | $3.002 | |

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Woman Owned Business Enterprise.

Supplier Notes: Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc is a Diversified,

Southern Counties Oil Co. [Ad] | [First Offer - $3.0044 | 1/ gallon | $3.0044 | |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

VALLEY OIL COMPANY || First Offer - $3.05 | 1/ gallon | $3.05 | |

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
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COUNTY OF SANTA CLARA
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION ABSTRACT

Attachment 1

COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY
Golden Gate Petrolrum Pinnacle Petroleum Southern Counties Qil Co. Mansfield Qil Co. Valley Qil Co. Falcon Fuels
1340 Arnold Dr. #231 7911 Professional Circle P. O. Box 4159 1025 Airport Plwy 785 Yuba Dr. 7300 Alondra Blvd. #204
Martinez, CA 94553 Huntington Beach, CaA 92648 Orange, CA 92863-4159 Gainesville, GA 30501 Mountain View, CA 94041 Paramount, CA 80723
Phone: (925) 228-2222 Phone: (714) 841-8877 Phone: (805) 389-3550 Phone: (678) 450-2282 Phone: 650-967-2253 Phone: (562) 272-4226
ITB Contact: Pat O'Keefe Contact: Liz McKinley Contact: Karen Koep Contact: Diane Burke Contact: Mike Taft Contact: Carol Chavez
ITB NUMBER: | 0139 DIESEL Delivery Time: Delivery Time: Delivery Time: Delivery Time: Delivery Time: Delivery Time:
Payment Terms: Payment Terms: Payment Terms: Payment Terms: Payment Terms: Pavment Terms:
DESCRI_PT_[O__N — _ QUANTITY uim UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE T(_)TAL PRfC_E UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE R UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE _TOTAL PRICE
UNLEADED 87 OCTANE i _ i
Lot 1 - 1 to 1,500 gallons (all agencies — .
excepl AC Transil) $0.2000 0.1880 no bid $0.1889 S
Lot 2 — 1,501 - 6,000 gallons (all agencies "
except AC Transil o lal $0.0599 0.0460 no bid $0.0450 =
Lot 3 - 6,001 - 10,000+ (all agencies except
AG Transit) o bid ($0.0313) (0.0373) (0.0237) $0.0172 aobid
Lot 4 - up to 1,500 gallons (AC Transit) no bid $0.2000 $0.1900 no bid no bid sobid
Lot 5 - 1,501 - 6,000 gallons (AC Transit) ro bid $0.0159 $0.1500 no bid no bid no bid
Lot 6 - 6,001 - 10,000+ gallons (AC Transit) o bid ($0.0348) (50.0261) (50.0345) no bid o bid
[DIESEL (ULSD & RED DYED)
Lot 1 - 1 to 1,500 gallons (all agencies ” .
except AC Transil) $0.1700 $1.0000 $0.2000 no bid 0.1890 no bid
Lot 2 —1,501 - 6,000 gallons (all agencies . .
except AC Transi) $0.0750 $0.2000 $0.0850 no bid 0.0850 no bid
i ?r;ﬁ'gg 1-10.000+i(ell agenglosiexcept $0.0008 $0.0020 $0.0044 (50.0004) 0.0500 no bid
Lot 4 -up to 1,500 gallons (AC Transit) $0.3200 $1.2000 $0.2180 no bid no bid no bid
Lot 5 - 1,501 - 6,000 (AC Transit} $0.0500 $0.2000 $0.1050 no bid no bid no bid
Lot 6 - 6,001 -10,000+ {(AC Transit) ($0.0502) $0.0189 $0.0063 (80.0455) no bid $0.0048
Lot 7 - up to 1,500 gallon (Red Dyed) . .
(Alameda County)) $0.1100 $3.0000 $0.1765 no bid $0.1490 ne bhid
Lot 8 - 1,501 - 6,000 gallons (Red Dyed) ! " .
(Alameda County) $0.0450 $0.1700 $0.0460 no bid $0.0690 no bid
Lot 9 - 6,001 - 10,000+ gallons (Red Dyed) .
(Alameda County) $0.0700 $1.0000 $0.0550 no bid $0.0800 no bid
BIODIESEL . =
I(-:?:‘Jm_nup 010,000 gallons (Alameda (50.0500) no bid (80.1900) (50.0457) no bid 1o hid
Lot 2 - up to 10,000 gallons (City of Belmant) $0.0500 no bid $0.1665 no bid $0.0574 no bid
Lot 3 - up to 10,000+ (Cily of Gilroy) $0.0800 no bid $0.0950 no bid no bid no bid
'l;:f_k“)' Up 010,000+ (East Hay Reglanal 50.1100 no bid $0.1665 no bid $0.1190 na bid
SUB TOTAL =
TAX RATE =
{Enter all non-taxable items} =
{Enter all non-taxable items} =
TOTAL=
LOCAL PREFERENCE DEDUCTION =
GRAND TOTAL =
[Receipt of Required Submittals (Yes/No)
Appendix {Enter Appendix No.}
Appendix {Enter Appendix No.}
Appendix {Enter Appendix No.}
Insurance in Compliance, if applicable
(YesiNo)
NOTES: _
LOCAL PREFERENCE REPORTING
Bid Includes Local Affected Award
Preference (Yes/No) Determination Financial Impact
N ]
POJ/Contract Number: [Prepared by: CC [Date: 1013014 [Approved by: Date:
Award:
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