
6/10/19 Bid Summary

Bid  

Item 

No.

Bid Description

Estimated 

Annual  

Usage

Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price

1.      2" Brass Cap 20 EA Brand: $23.8100 Brand: Smith Cooper $12.9000 Brand: Merit Brass $11.000 Brand: Matco Norca $25.250 Brand: Smith Cooper

Product No: 748-020 Product No: 1006C Product No: XNL116-32 Product No: DB-CA082F Product No: 36C-1020L

2.      4" Gland Pack w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated 70 EA Brand: Kennedy $27.8230 Brand: Sigma $20.5000 Brand: Tyler $28.400 Brand: Tyler Union $26.030 Brand: Tyler

 Retainer Product No: 108-GPA-04 Product No: EDGY MGB Product No: 523352 Product No: Product No:

3. 4" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated 12 EA Brand: Star Pipe Prod $77.3140 Brand: Tyler / Union $34.6500 Brand: Tyler $39.000 Brand: Tyler Union $78.090 Brand: Tyler

Product No: MJSC 04 Product No: 31888 Product No: 31888 Product No: Product No:

4. 6" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated 14 EA Brand: Star Pipe Prod $123.2200 Brand: Tyler / Union $61.0000 Brand: Tyler $68.000 Brand: Tyler Union $117.820 Brand: Tyler

Product No: GM5 Sleeve Product No: 31710 Product No: 31710 Product No: Product No: 395690

5. 6" Gland Pack w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts and Epoxy Coated Retainer 49 EA Brand: Kennedy $34.4110 Brand: Sigma $26.4000 Brand: Tyler $32.800 Brand: Tyler Union $32.880 Brand: Tyler

Product No: 108-GPA-06 Product No: EDG6 MGB Product No: 523369 Product No: Product No:

6. 8" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated 10 EA Brand: Star Pipe Prod $49.0240 Brand: Tyler / Union $96.4000 Brand: Tyler $109.000 Brand: Tyler Union $155.500 Brand: Tyler

Product No: MJSL08 Product No: 31727 Product No: 31727 Product No: Product No: 397014

7. 8" Gland Pack w/Tri-Pac Blue T-Bolts and Epoxy Coated Retainer 35 EA Brand: Kennedy $40.3410 Brand: Sigma $27.5000 Brand: Tyler $37.400 Brand: Tyler Union $36.300 Brand: Tyler

Product No: 108-GPA-08 Product No: EDG8 MGB Product No: 523376 Product No: Product No:

8. 10" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated 4 EA Brand: Star Pipe Prod $231.5040 Brand: Tyler / Union $114.0000 Brand: Tyler $129.000 Brand: Tyler Union $223.310 Brand: Tyler

Product No: 21T105112T Product No: 31826 Product No: 31826 Product No: Product No: 397656

9. 10" Gland Pack w/Tri-Pac Blue T-Bolts and Epoxy Coated Retainer 14 EA Brand: Kennedy $76.8010 Brand: Sigma $39.4500 Brand: Tyler $52.300 Brand: Tyler Union $50.000 Brand: Tyler

Product No: 108-GPA-10 Product No: EDG10 MGB Product No: 523383 Product No: Product No:

10. 12" Tyler/Union C153 MJ Solid Sleeve- Epoxy Coated 4 EA Brand: Star Pipe Prod $198.6010 Brand: Tyler / Union $148.0000 Brand: Tyler $168.000 Brand: Tyler Union $294.550 Brand: Tyler

Product No: MJSL 12 Product No: 31840 Product No: 31840 Product No: Product No: 397663

11. 12" Gland Pack w/Tri-Pac Blue T-Bolts and Epoxy Coated Retainer 14 EA Brand: Kennedy $36.3870 Brand: Sigma $41.5000 Brand: Tyler $53.400 Brand: Tyler Union $52.060 Brand: Tyler

Product No: 108-GPA-12 Product No: EDG12 MGB Product No: 523390 Product No: Product No:

12. 2" Brass Elbow 20 EA Brand: $21.9460 Brand: Smith Cooper $18.2500 Brand: Merit Brass $15.500 Brand:  Matco Norca $29.450 Brand: Smith Cooper

Product No: 535-100N Product No: 1020C Product No: XNL101-32 Product No: DB-L9008LF Product No: 36F-1020L

13. 2" Brass Coupling 15 EA Brand: $416.9700 Brand: Smith Cooper $15.7500 Brand: Merit Brass $13.500 Brand: Matco Norca $30.160 Brand: Smith Cooper

Product No: 535-700N Product No: 1020-36CPL Product No: XNL111-32 Product No: DB-CP08LP Product No: 36CP-1020L

14. 3" Mueller, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxFL, MJxMJ 24 EA Brand: Mueller $18.9070 Brand: Mueller $315.0000 Brand: Clow Valve $335.000 Brand: AVK 315.65 / 299.40 Brand: Clow

Product No: P-2361 Product No: A-2361-3 Product No: 26380321117400/26380330117400 Product No: S65 Product No: 2639

15. 4" Mueller, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxFL , MJxMJ 24 EA Brand: Mueller $669.5440 Brand: Mueller $356.0000 Brand: Clow Valve $331.000 Brand: AVK 352.35 / 336.77 Brand: Clow

Product No: P-2361 Product No: A-2361-4 Product No: 26380421117400/26380430117400 Product No: S65 Product No: 2639

16. 6" Mueller, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxFL , MJxMJ 15 EA Brand: Mueller $526.5570 Brand: Mueller $438.0000 Brand: Clow Valve $423.000 Brand: AVK 449.85 / 449.85 Brand: Clow

Product No: P-2361 Product No: A-2161-6 Product No: 26380621117400/2638063017400 Product No: S65 Product No: 2639

17. 8" Mueller, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxFL, MJxMJ 15 EA Brand: Mueller $664.7860 Brand: Mueller $724.0000 Brand: Clow Valve $673.000 Brand: AVK 715.84 / 702.60 Brand: Clow

Product No: P-2361 Product No: A-2361-8 Product No: 26380821117400/26380830117400 Product No: S65 Product No: 2639

18. 10" Mueller, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxFL, MJxMJ 7 EA Brand: Mueller $2,232.8900 Brand: Mueller $1,129.0000 Brand: Clow Valve $1,050.000 Brand: AVK 1116.05 / 1116.05 Brand: Clow

Product No: P-2361 Product No: A-2361-10 Product No: 26381021117400/26381030117400 Product No: 265 Product No: 2639

19. 12" Mueller, A-2361 316 SS Bolts, EPDM Wedge MJxMJ, MJxFL 10 EA Brand: Mueller $1,692.0040 Brand: Mueller $1,428.0000 Brand: Clow Valve $1,328.000 Brand: AVK 1412.12 / 1347.74 Brand: Clow

Product No: P-2361 Product No: A-2361-12 Product No: 26381221117400/26381230117400 Product No: S65 Product No: 2639

20. 3/4" Curb Stop Mueller B-20200 20 EA Brand: Mueller $78.1890 Brand: Mueller $53.2500 Brand: Ford $49.000 Brand: FORD $49.990 Brand: Ford

Product No: MM10283NF Product No: B-20200 Product No: B11-333-W-NL Product No: B11-333W-NL Product No: B11-333W-NL

21. 2" Curb Stop Mueller B-20200 24 EA Brand: Mueller $447.2210 Brand: Mueller $215.0000 Brand: Ford $215.000 Brand: FORD $193.930 Brand: Ford

Product No: MH10284NR Product No: B-20200-2 Product No: B11-777-W-NL Product No: B11-777W-NL Product No: B11-777W-NL

22. 2" Corp Stop B-25008, meets low lead requirement 24 EA Brand: no bid Brand: Mueller $203.0000 Brand: Ford $210.000 Brand: FORD $189.280 Brand: Ford

Product No: Product No: B-25008-2 Product No: FB1000-7-Q-NL Product No: FB1000-7Q-NL Product No: FB1000Q20-NL

23. 3/4" Brass Elbow 25 EA Brand: $5.2580 Brand: Smith Cooper $3.9500 Brand: Merit Brass $3.500 Brand: Matco Norca $6.000 Brand: Smith Cooper

Product No: 535-100I Product No: 1006L Product No: XNL101-12 Product No: DB-L90042F Product No: 36E-1006L

24. Angle Meter Valve, H-14258 3/4", meet low lead req. 24 EA Brand: Mueller $127.4000 Brand: Mueller $48.0000 Brand: Ford $35.400 Brand: FORD $31.940 Brand: Ford

Product No: H-14258N Product No: H-14258 Product No: FB1000-7-Q-NL Product No: KV43-332W-A-NL Product No: KV43-332W-Q-NL

25. Compression Union, H-15404 3/4", meet low lead req. 24 EA Brand: Mueller $69.8500 Brand: Mueller $20.0000 Brand: FORD $21.650 Brand: FORD $18.290 Brand: Ford

Product No: H-15404N Product No: H-15404 Product No: C66-33-Q-NL Product No: C66-33-NL Product No: C44-33Q-NL

26. Compression Union, H-15404 1", meet low lead req. 24 EA Brand: Mueller $84.2000 Brand: Mueller $39.9000 Brand: FORD $43.200 Brand: FORD $36.560 Brand: Ford

Product No: H-15404N Product No: H-15404 Product No: C66-44-Q-NL Product No: C66-44-NL Product No: C44-44Q-NL

27. Compression Union, H-15404 1 1/2", meet low lead req. 6 EA Brand: Mueller $128.3600 Brand: Mueller $95.0000 Brand: FORD $89.000 Brand: FORD $79.660 Brand: Ford

Product No: H-15404N Product No: H-15404P Product No: C66-66-IDR7-NL Product No: C66-66-1DR7-NL Product No: C44-77Q-NL

28. Compression Union, H-15404 2", meet low lead req. 12 EA Brand: Mueller $176.2330 Brand: Mueller $161.0000 Brand: FORD $120.000 Brand: FORD $107.330 Brand: Ford

Product No: H-15404N Product No: H-15404P Product No: C66-77-IDR7-NL Product No: C66-77-10R7-NL Product No: C44-77Q-NL

29. Romac 4" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (8-inch length) 10 EA Brand: 552-557 X 8 $241.1900 Brand: Romac $126.5000 Brand: FORD $88.300 Brand: Romac $140.220 Brand: Romac

Product No: Product No: SS2-527-8 Product No: FS2-4X75 Product No: Product No: 7-1/2" 474-557 / 12-1/2' 474-557

30. Romac 4" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (12-inch length) 10 EA Brand: 552-557 X 12 $375.0400 Brand: Romac $197.0000 Brand: FORD $133.500 Brand: Romac $218.100 Brand: Romac

Product No: Product No: SS2-527-12 Product No: FS2-4X125 Product No: Product No: 7-1/2" 684-764 / 12-1/2" 684-764

31. Romac 6" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (8-inch length) 10 EA Brand: 552-764 X 8 $277.2600 Brand: Romac $145.6000 Brand: FORD $96.100 Brand: Romac $161.200 Brand: Romac

Product No: Product No: SS2-737-8 Product No: FS2-6X75 Product No: Product No: 7-1/2" 899-979 / 12-1/2" 899-979

32. Romac 6" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (12-inch length) 10 EA Brand: 552-764 X 12 $406.2900 Brand: Romac $213.4500 Brand: FORD $137.700 Brand: Romac $236.220 Brand: Romac

Product No: Product No: SS2-737-12 Product No: FS2-6X125 Product No: Product No: 71-2" 1160-1240 / 12-1/2" 1160-1240

33. Romac 8" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (8-inch length) 10 EA Brand: 552-899 X 8 $317.0000 Brand: Romac $165.9000 Brand: FORD $104.900 Brand: Romac $184.500 Brand: Romac

Product No: Product No: SS2-939-8 Product No: FS2-8X75 Product No: Product No: 12" 1365-1445 / 15" 1365-1445

34. Romac 8" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (12-inch length) 10 EA Brand: 552-899 X 12 $461.0000 Brand: Romac $241.3000 Brand: FORD $153.200 Brand: Romac $268.360 Brand: Ford 

Product No: Product No: SS2-939-12 Product No: FS2-8X125 Product No: Product No: N/A

35. Romac 10" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (8-inch length) 7 EA Brand: 552-1104 X 8 $320.0000 Brand: Romac $167.7000 Brand: FORD $111.800 Brand: Romac $186.540 Brand: EBAA/Tyler

Product No: Product No: SS2-1150-8 Product No: FS2-10X75 Product No: Product No:

36. Romac 10" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (12-inch length) 7 EA Brand: 552-1104 X 12 $712.0000 Brand: Romac $372.6000 Brand: FORD $196.300 Brand: Romac $414.410 Brand: EBAA/Tyler

Product No: Product No: SS2-1150-12 Product No: FS2-10X125 Product No: Product No:

37. Romac 12" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (8-inch length) 10 EA Brand: 552-1350 X 8 $411.2000 Brand: Romac $216.0000 Brand: FORD $120.500 Brand: Romac $239.060 Brand: EBAA/Tyler

Product No: Product No: SS2-1395-8 Product No: FS2-12X75 Product No: Product No:

38. Romac 12" SS2 Full Circle Clamp (12-inch length) 10 EA Brand: 552-1350 X 12 $809.2600 Brand: Romac $423.0000 Brand: FORD $210.500 Brand: Romac $470.500 Brand: EBAA/Tyler

Product No: Product No: SS2-1395-12 Product No: FS2-12X125 Product No: Product No:

39. Brass ¾” x 1” CC Bushing 12 EA Brand: $4.2770 Brand: Mueller $38.0000 Brand: NO BID MUELLER ITEM Brand: Matco Norca $5.040 Brand: EBAA/Tyler

Product No: 535-600KI Product No: H-10036 Product No: Product No: Product No:

40. 4" Megalug EBAA Series 1100 for DI & C900 20 EA Brand: EBAA $78.9200 Brand: EBAA-DIP $34.0000 Brand: EBAA $53.000 Brand: EBAA $29.750 Brand: Smith Cooper

w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: 21AAF8041104 Product No: 1104 DECY Product No: 1104DSC / 2004PSC Product No: Product No: 86NI4006040C

41. 6" Megalug EBAA Series 1100 for DI & C900 35 EA Brand: EBAA $88.9900 Brand: EBAA-DIP $40.2500 Brand: EBAA $71.000 Brand: EBAA $37.500 Brand: Vinyltech, N.A., Royal

w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: 21AMF8061106 Product No: 1106-DECY Product No: 1106DSC / 2006PSC Product No: Product No:

42. 8" Megalug EBAA Series 1100 for DI & C900 35 EA Brand: EBAA $138.2500 Brand: EBAA-DI $56.4000 Brand: EBAA $87.000 Brand: EBAA $43.900 Brand: Smith Cooper

w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: 21AMF8061108 Product No: 1108-DECY Product No: 1108DSC / 2008PSC Product No: Product No: 86NI4006060C

43. 10" Megalug EBAA Series 1100 for DI & C900 20 EA Brand: EBAA $125.1400 Brand: EBAA-DI $80.5000 Brand: EBAA $140.000 Brand: EBAA $71.570 Brand: Smith Cooper

w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: 21AMF8061110 Product No: 1110-DECY Product No: 1110DSC / 2010PSC Product No: Product No: 86NI4020060C

44. 12" Megalug EBAA Series 1100 for DI & C900 25 EA Brand: EBAA $182.0750 Brand: EBAA-DI $105.0000 Brand: EBAA $146.000 Brand: EBAA $92.840 Brand: Smith Cooper

w/Tri-Pac BlueT-Bolts, Gasket and Epoxy Coated Retainer Product No: 21AMF8121112 Product No: 1112-DECY Product No: 1112DSC / 2012PSC Product No: Product No: 86NI4020040C

45. 3/4" x 4" Brass Nipple 20 EA Brand: $11.0070 Brand: Smith Cooper $4.9500 Brand: Merit Brass $3.200 Brand: Matco Norca $3.500 Brand: Smith Cooper
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6/10/19 Bid Summary

Product No: NBR044 Product No: Product No: 2012-400 Product No: DNBR044 Product No: 86NI4020120C

46. 8" PVC Sewer Pipe, for GV Standpipe Use 200 FT Brand: P.W. Pipe $5.1980 Brand: Vinyltech $4.7500 Brand: North American $4.000 Brand: JM EAGLE $9.170 Brand: Smith Cooper

Product No: 800-35-PVC Product No: SDR 35 Product No: SDR35PX20 Product No: Product No: 36SS1020L

47. 3/4" x 6" Brass Nipple 20 EA Brand: $8.0430 Brand: Smith Cooper $6.5600 Brand: Merit Brass $4.500 Brand: Matco Norca $5.120 Brand: Smith Cooper

Product No: NBR046 Product No: Product No: 2012-600 Product No: DNBR046 Product No: 96BP4020200

48. 2" x 6" Brass Nipple 20 EA Brand: $26.5710 Brand: Smith Cooper $21.6500 Brand: Merit Brass $15.000 Brand: Matco Norca $16.930 Brand: Clow

Product No: NBR086 Product No: Product No: 2032-600 Product No: DNBR086 Product No: 75

49. 2" x 4" Brass Nipple 30 EA Brand: $17.9990 Brand: Smith Cooper $14.6500 Brand: Merit Brass $10.000 Brand: Matco Norca $11.460 Brand: Oldcastle

Product No: NBR084 Product No: Product No: 2032-400 Product No: DNBR084 Product No: G5 BOX

50. 2" x 12" Brass Nipple 20 EA Brand: $52.1580 Brand: Smith Cooper $42.6500 Brand: Merit Brass $29.000 Brand: Matco Norca $33.360 Brand: Oldcastle

Product No: NBR0812 Product No: Product No: 2032-1200 Product No: DNBR0812 Product No: G5 Water

51. 2" Plug 20 EA Brand: $12.0800 Brand: Smith Cooper $8.4500 Brand: Merit Brass $7.200 Brand: Matco Norca $16.110 Brand: Oldcastle

Product No: 535-400N Product No: Product No: XNL117-32 Product No: DB-P208LF Product No: F8 BOX

52. 2" Brass Pipe 400 FT Brand: no bid Brand: Merit Brass $47.0000 Brand: Merit Brass $25.500 Brand: Kumbridge lee $33.550 Brand: Oldcastle

Product No: Product No: Product No: N/A Product No: Product No: F8 LID

53. Clow Model 75 Fire Hydrant 20 EA Brand: no bid Brand: CLOW $1,475.0000 Brand: Clow Valve $1,670.000 Brand: CLOW $1,511.500 Brand: Romac

Product No: Product No: Model 75 Product No: 10750310010400 Product No: 75 Product No: XR501 4.215-5.60 7"

54. Christy G5 Box 50 EA Brand: Christy $48.8130 Brand: Christy $27.6500 Brand: Oldcastle Precast $28.000 Brand: CHRISTY'S $27.070 Brand: Romac

Product No: G5 Box Product No: G-5 Product No: G5BOX Product No: G05T Product No: XR501 6.275-7.60 7"

55. Christy G5 Cover 50 EA Brand: Christy $35.3000 Brand: Christy $30.7000 Brand: Oldcastle Precast $21.000 Brand: CHRISTY'S $18.860 Brand: Romac

Product No: G5C Product No: G-5C Product No: G5C Product No: G05CT Product No: XR501 8.40-9.75 7"

56. Christy F1 Sewer Box 60 EA Brand: Christy $22.9090 Brand: Christy $13.6500 Brand: Oldcastle Precast $11.250 Brand: CHRISTY'S $13.270 Brand: Romac

Product No: F1 Box Product No: F1 Product No: F1BOX Product No: F01 Product No: XR501 1050-12.15 8"

57. Christy F1 Sewer Cover 60 EA Brand: Christy $30.7860 Brand: Christy $11.5000 Brand: Oldcastle Precast $13.950 Brand: CHRISTY'S $16.760 Brand: Romac

Product No: F08C Product No: F8D Product No: F8DS Product No: F08C Product No: XR501 12.50-14.41 8"

58. Romac XR501 Extended Range Transition Coupling, 4 inch 4 EA Brand: ROMAC $202.9880 Brand: Romac $210.0000  FORD $141.000 Brand: Romac $167.700 Brand: Clow

Epoxy Coated SS Trim Product No: XR501 Product No: XR501-560X8 Product No: FC2W-4SH Product No: XR501 Product No: 4500

59. Romac XR501 Extended Range Transition Coupling 6 inch 6 EA Brand: ROMAC $408.4480 Brand: Romac $280.0000 Brand: FORD $170.000 Brand: Romac $229.090 Brand: Clow

Epoxy Coated SS Trim Product No: XR501 Product No: XR501-760X7 Product No: FC2W-6SH Product No: XR501 Product No: 4500

60. Romac XR501 Extended Range Transition Coupling 8 inch 6 EA Brand: ROMAC $468.7860 Brand: Romac $331.0000 Brand: FORD $207.000 Brand: Romac $272.540 Brand: Clow

Epoxy Coated SS Trim Product No: XR501 Product No: XR501-975X7 Product No: FC22-8SH Product No: XR501 Product No: 4500

61. Romac XR501 Extended Range Transition Coupling 10 inch 4 EA Brand: ROMAC $618.5120 Brand: Romac $358.0000 Brand: FORD $294.000 Brand: Romac $352.120 Brand: Clow

Epoxy Coated SS Trim Product No: XR501 Product No: XR501-1215X8 Product No: FC2W-10SH Product No: RX501 Product No: 4500

62. Romac XR501 Extended Range Transition Coupling 12 inch 12 EA Brand: ROMAC $328.4500 Brand: Romac $439.0000 Brand: FORD $333.000 Brand: Romac $410.610 Brand: Clow

Epoxy Coated SS Trim Product No: XR501 Product No: XR501-1441X8 Product No: FC2W-12SH Product No: RX501 Product No: 4500

63. Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150 , FLxFL, 4 inch 8 EA Brand: no bid Brand: Mueller $545.0000 Brand: Henry Pratt $658.000 Brand: AVK $470.000 Brand: Clow

Product No: Product No: Lineseal Product No: 041FF-0167ESSLNP2 Product No: 5816 Product No: 4500

64. Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150, FLxFL 6 inch 6 EA Brand: no bid Brand: Mueller $560.0000 Brand: Henry Pratt $675.000 Brand: AVK $482.560 Brand: Clow

Product No: Product No: Lineseal Product No: 061FF-0167ESSLNP2 Product No: 5816 Product No: 4500

65. Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150, FLxFL 8 inch 2 EA Brand: no bid Brand: Mueller $719.0000 Brand: Henry Pratt $799.000 Brand: AVK $618.180 Brand: Ford

Product No: Product No: Lineseal Product No: 081FF-0167ESSLNP2 Product No: 5816 Product No: B11-333W-NL

66. Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150, FLxFL 10 inch 1 EA Brand: no bid Brand: Mueller $990.0000 Brand: Henry Pratt $1,060.000 Brand: AVK $852.950 Brand: Ford

Product No: Product No: Lineseal Product No: 101FF-0255ESSLNP2 Product No: 5816 Product No: B11-44W-NL

67. Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150, FLxFL 12 inch 1 EA Brand: no bid Brand: Mueller $1,185.0000 Brand: Henry Pratt $1,250.000 Brand: AVK $1,035.150 Brand: Romac

Product No: Product No: Lineseal Product No: 121FF-0255ESSLNP2 Product No: 5816 Product No: 202NS048010CC/202NS054020CC

68. Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150, FLxFL 16 inch As Brand: no bid Brand: Mueller $2,315.0000 Brand: Henry Pratt $2,375.000 Brand: AVK $1,985.270 Brand: Romac

required Product No: Product No: Lineseal Product No: 161FF-0255ESSLNP3 Product No: 5816 Product No: 202NS069010CC/202NS06920CC

69. Butterfly valve, Lineseal III Class 150, FLxFL 24 inch As Brand: no bid Brand: Mueller $4,853.0000 Brand: Henry Pratt $4,750.000 Brand: AVK $4,165.270 Brand: Romac

required Product No: Product No: Lineseal Product No: 241FF-0542ESSLNP4 Product No: 5816 Product No: 202NS090510CC/202NS090520CC

70. Mueller 300 3/4" meter valve, FIPxFIP/meter nut/MIP 24 EA Brand: Mueller $56.6100 Brand: Mueller $49.2000 Brand: MUELLER NO BID Brand: FORD $60.530 Brand: Romac

Product No: 00000300 Product No: B-20200 Product No: Product No: BA13-332WW-NL Product No: 202NS121210CC/202NS121220CC

71. Mueller 300 1" meter valve, FIPxFIP/meter nut/MIP 24 EA Brand: Mueller $68.3170 Brand: Mueller $73.6000 Brand: MUELLER NO BID Brand: FORD $90.290 Brand: Romac

Product No: 00000300 Product No: B-20200 Product No: Product No: BA13-444WW-NL Product No: 202NS143810CC/202NS143820CC

72. Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 4-inch X 1-inch CC 4 EA Brand: ROMAC $159.7650 Brand: Romac $65.3000 Brand: ROMAC $46.000 Brand: Romac $72.260 Brand: Wieland Copper

Product No: 202NS Product No: 202NS-480-1CC Product No: 202NS048041 Product No: Product No:

73. Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 4-inch X 2-inch CC 4 EA Brand: no bid Brand: Romac $71.0000 Brand: ROMAC $50.000 Brand: Romac $78.690 Brand: Wieland Copper

Product No: Product No: 202NS-480-2CC Product No: 202NS048071 Product No: Product No:

74. Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 6-inch X 1-inch CC 6 EA Brand: ROMAC $200.6480 Brand: Romac $75.0000 Brand: ROMAC $53.000 Brand: Romac $83.020 Brand: Wieland Copper

Product No: 202NS Product No: 202NS-690-1CC Product No: 202NS069041 Product No: Product No:

75. Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 6-inch X 2-inch CC 6 EA Brand: no bid Brand: Romac $81.5000 Brand: ROMAC $58.000 Brand: Romac $90.170 Brand: Wieland Copper

Product No: Product No: 202NS-690-2CC Product No: 202NS069071 Product No: Product No:

76. Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 8-inch X 1-inch CC 6 EA Brand: ROMAC $253.6800 Brand: Romac $86.4000 Brand: ROMAC $62.000 Brand: Romac $96.560 Brand: Wieland Copper

Product No: 202NS Product No: 202NS-905-1CC Product No: 202NS069041 Product No: Product No:

77. Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 8-inch X 2-inch CC 6 EA Brand: no bid Brand: Romac $92.6000 Brand: ROMAC $66.000 Brand: Romac $102.920 Brand: Black Swan

Product No: Product No: 202NS-905-2CC Product No: 202NS090571 Product No: Product No: 4055 - Quart 

78. Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 10-inch X 1-inch CC 5 EA Brand: ROMAC $327.5600 Brand: Romac $104.8500 Brand: ROMAC $75.000 Brand: Romac $116.590 Brand: Agave Wire (Solid)

Product No: 202NS Product No: 202NC-1110-1CC Product No: 202NS090541 Product No: Product No:

79. Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 10-inch X 2-inch CC 5 EA Brand: no bid Brand: Romac $113.0000 Brand: ROMAC $80.000 Brand: Romac $125.670 Brand: T Christy Enterprise

Product No: Product No: 202NS-1110-2CC Product No: 202NS111071 Product No: Product No: TA-ND-6-BW

80. Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 12-inch X 1-inch CC 6 EA Brand: ROMAC $421.7100 Brand: Romac $122.6500 Brand: ROMAC $87.000 Brand: Romac $135.730 Brand: T Christy Enterprise

Product No: 202NS Product No: 202NS-1320-1CC Product No: 202NS132041 Product No: Product No: 865

81. Romac DBL Strap Saddles 202NS 12-inch X 2-inch CC 6 EA Brand: no bid Brand: Romac $131.0000 Brand: ROMAC $93.000 Brand: Romac $145.360 Brand: 2" 10mil

Product No: Product No: 202NS-1320-2CC Product No: 202NS132071 Product No: Product No: 865

82. .75" Type K copper, 100 feet/roll 2 RL Brand: no bid Brand: Cambridge $238.8000 Brand: Mueller Industries $337.000 Brand: Kumbridge lee $850.000 Brand: Tyler

Product No: Product No: K-Soft Product No: KS06100 Product No: Product No:

83. 1" Type K copper, 100 feet/roll 2 RL Brand: no bid Brand: Cambridge $298.8000 Brand: Mueller Industries $334.000 Brand: Kumbridge lee $1,105.310 Brand: Tyler

Product No: Product No: K-Soft Product No: KS10100 Product No: Product No:

84. 1.5" Type K copper, 100 feet/roll 2 RL Brand: no bid Brand: Brand: Mueller  Industries $667.000 Brand: Kumbridge lee $1,726.980 Brand: Tyler

Product No: Product No: Product No: KS14100 Product No: Product No:

85. 1.25" Type K copper, 100 feet/roll 1 RL Brand: no bid Brand: Brand: Mueller  Industries $460.000 Brand: Kumbridge lee $1,325.000 Brand: American Pipe

Product No: Product No: Product No: KS12100 Product No: Product No:

86. 2" Type K copper, 100 feet/roll 1 RL Brand: no bid Brand: Brand: Mueller  Industries $1,070.000 Brand: Kumbridge lee $2,745.000 Brand: Vinyltech, Napco

Product No: Product No: Product No: KS20060 ***(60' rolls)*** Product No: Product No:

87. Pipe joint lube 24 EA Brand: Christy $7.2720 Brand: Brand: Proselect $4.000 Brand: North Town $9.400 Brand: All-Spec, Crispin, Pipeline Products

Product No: 12M-PRO-QT Product No: Product No: PSLUBXL1Q Product No: Product No:

88. Blue insulated tracer wire, 10 ga 4 RL Brand: $1,268.9060 Brand: Brand: Southwire $85.000 Brand: North Town $215.800 Brand: Mueller

Product No: COP-TW1038-SFBLUE Product No: Product No: 10ga Solid THHN Wire Blue Product No: Product No:

89. Blue non-metallic "Water Line Buried Below" warning tape, 4 RL Brand: Christy $123.6410 Brand: Brand: Presco $30.000 Brand: North Town $39.000 Brand: Ford, Smith Cooper

  6" x 1000' Product No: TA-2T-6-81RA Product No: Product No: ND6104B52737 Product No: Product No:

90. 10 Mil tape 100 RL PW $5.6700 Proselect $4.000 Brand: North Town $2.960 US Pipe Fabrication

PSPWT210 Product No:

91. Fire hydrant, Clow Model 865 5 EA Brand: no bid Brand: Brand: Clow Valve $2,030.000 Brand: Clow $1,873.740 Brand: Tyler

Product No: Product No: Product No: 586512100104SY9 Product No: 865 Product No:
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92 Adapter Flange, AC to DIP, MJxFL 3-inch 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 029748 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: Tyler %

List Price: List Price: $100.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:
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93 Adapter Flange, AC to DIP, MJxFL 4-inch 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 029762 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: Jim Cox Sales %

List Price: List Price: $128.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

94 Adapter Flange, AC to DIP, MJxFL 6-inch 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 029786 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: Jim Cox Sales %

List Price: List Price: $166.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

95 Adapter Flange, AC to DIP, MJxFL 8-inch 2 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 029809 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: Vinyltech, Napco %

List Price: List Price: $253.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

96 Epoxy Coated TEE MJ, MJxFl, FL 4-inch 3 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 032250 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: Piranha %

List Price: List Price: $215.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

97 Epoxy Coated TEE MJ, MJxFl, FL 6-inch 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 032298 % Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: Joints %

List Price: List Price: $359.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

98 Epoxy Coated TEE MJ, MJxFl, FL 8-inch 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 032359 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: Max %

List Price: List Price: $527.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

99 Epoxy Coated TEE MJ, MJxFl, FL 10-inch 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 031994 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: Multi, Royal %

List Price: List Price: $919.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

100 Epoxy Coated TEE MJ, MJxFl, FL 12-inch 10 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 032106 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $1219.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

101 Epoxy Coated TEE MJ, MJxFl, FL 16-inch 2 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 034636 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $2872.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

102 Epoxy Coated Reducer MJ, MJxFl, FL 4-inch 2 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 132912 30% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $340.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

103 Epoxy Coated Reducer MJ, MJxFl, FL 6-inch 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 132950 30% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $340.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

104 Epoxy Coated Reducer MJ, MJxFl, FL 8-inch 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 132295 30% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $446.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

105 Epoxy Coated Reducer MJ, MJxFl, FL 10-inch 2 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 132516 30% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $711.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

106 Epoxy Coated Reducer MJ, MJxFl, FL 12-inch 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 132578 30% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $1011.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

107 Epoxy Coated Reducer MJ, MJxFl, FL 16-inch 2 EA Brand: % Brand: Tyler 132677 30% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $2386.00 List Price: LP2019-ND* List Price: List Price:

108 Ductile Irion Pipe Class 52 4-inch 20 ft Brand: % Brand: VSP / MCWANE 0% Brand: McWane Ductile -5% Brand: US Pipe Fab 7.5% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $20.80 List Price: $17.36 List Price: $10.00 List Price:

109 Ductile Irion Pipe Class 52 6-inch 60 ft Brand: % Brand: VSP / MCWANE 0% Brand: McWane Ductile -5% Brand: US Pipe Fab 5% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $16.50 List Price: $16.46 List Price: $5.00 List Price:

110 Ductile Irion Pipe Class 52 8-inch 60 ft Brand: % Brand: VSP / MCWANE 0% Brand: McWane Ductile -5% Brand: US Pipe Fab 7% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: 22.60 List Price: $18.95 List Price: $22.00 List Price:

111 Ductile Irion Pipe Class 52 10-inch 40 ft Brand: % Brand: VSP / MCWANE 0% Brand: McWane Ductile -5% Brand: US Pipe Fab 6% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $29.60 List Price:$24.84 List Price: $28.00 List Price:

112 Ductile Irion Pipe Class 52 12-inch 60 ft Brand: % Brand: VSP / MCWANE 0% Brand: McWane Ductile -5% Brand: US Pipe Fab 10% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $37.40 List Price: $31.28 List Price: $36.00 List Price:

113 Ductile Irion Pipe Class 52 16-inch 40 ft Brand: % Brand: VSP / MCWANE 0% Brand: McWane Ductile -5% Brand: US Pipe Fab 10% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $53.00 List Price: $45.27 List Price: $52.00 List Price:

114 C900 DR14 pipe 4-inch 40 ft Brand: % Brand: Vinyl Tech 15% Brand: North America %23*currently Brand: North American % sell price Brand: %

List Price: DR14 List Price: $3.55 List Price:$3.55 List Price: $3.50 List Price:

115 C900 DR14 pipe 6-inch 120 ft Brand: % Brand: Vinyl Tech 15% Brand: North America %23*currently Brand: North American % sell price Brand: %

List Price: DR14 List Price: $7.01 List Price:$7.01 List Price: $6.50 List Price:

116 C900 DR14 pipe 8-inch 120 ft Brand: % Brand: Vinyl Tech 15% Brand: North America %23*currently Brand: North American % sell price Brand: %

List Price: DR14 List Price: $12.04 List Price:$12.04 List Price: $10.50 List Price:

117 C900 DR14 pipe 10-inch 60 ft Brand: % Brand: Vinyl Tech 15% Brand: North America %23*currently Brand: North American % sell price Brand: %

List Price: DR14 List Price: $18.33 List Price: $18.33 List Price: $16.00 List Price:

118 C900 DR14 pipe 12-inch 120 ft Brand: % Brand: Vinyl Tech 15% Brand: North America %23*currently Brand: North American % sell price Brand: %

List Price: DR14 List Price: $25.91 List Price: $25.91 List Price: $23.00 List Price:

119 C900 DR14 pipe 16-inch 40 ft Brand: % Brand: Vinyl Tech 10% Brand: North America % N/A Brand: North American % sell price Brand: %

List Price: DR14 List Price: $70.00 List Price: N/A List Price: $67.00 List Price:

120 Pipeline products ARV enclosure Hunter Green 24-inch x 30-inch 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Pipeline Prod 20% Brand: Pipeline Products % N/A Brand: Pipeline Products 11% Brand: %

List Price: List Price:$1023.95 List Price: N/A VC-324-WP-PC List Price: $1000.00 List Price:

121 Pipeline products Backflow enclosure Hunter Green WTS858E 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Pipeline Prod 20% Brand: Pipeline Products % N/A Brand: Pipeline Products 31% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $493.58 List Price: N/A BFE-200-PC List Price: $700.00 List Price:

122 Pipeline products Sample Station enclosure Hunter Green 18"x42"x30" 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Pipeline Prod 20% Brand: Pipeline Products % N/A Brand: Pipeline Products 17% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $593.65 List Price: N/A WTS-858-2P-PC List Price: $700.00 List Price:

123 Mueller D5 Rebuild kit 1 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $1495.00 List Price: List Price: List Price:

124 Mueller CL12 Rebuild kit 1 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller % Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $10,480.00 List Price: List Price: List Price:

125 Mueller D5 Drill bit 15/16" DIP 2 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: 36037 List Price:$155.70 List Price: List Price: List Price:

126 Mueller D5 Drill bit 5/8" DIP 2 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: 33253 List Price: $175.48 List Price: List Price: List Price:

127 Mueller D5 Drill bit 1 15/16" DIP 1 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: 33056 List Price: 465.23 List Price: List Price: List Price:

128 Mueller D5 Drill bit 15/16" C900 1 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: 61992 List Price: $103.64 List Price: List Price: List Price:

129 Mueller D5 Drill bit 3/4" C900 1 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: 61990 List Price: $129.24 List Price: List Price: List Price:

130 Mueller D5 Drill bit 1 15/16" C900 1 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: 33540 List Price: $267.83 List Price: List Price: List Price:

131 Mueller CL12 Shell Cutter 3 1/2" 1 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: 83203 List Price: $1,478.21 List Price: List Price: List Price:

132 Mueller CL12 Shell Cutter 5 1/2" 1 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: 83134 List Price: $2,221.38 List Price: List Price: List Price:

133 Mueller CL12 Shell Cutter 7 1/2" 1 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: 83135 List Price: $2,836.21 List Price: List Price: List Price:

134 Mueller CL12 Shell Cutter 9 1/2" 1 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: 83140 List Price: $3,288.27 List Price: List Price: List Price:

135 Mueller CL12 Shell Cutter 11 1/2" 1 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: NO BID MUELLER D5 or CL12 Items % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

List Price: 83141 List Price: $4,694.83 List Price: List Price: List Price:

136 IP/CC Plug 3/4-inch 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: A.Y. McDonald 30% Brand: FORD 20% Brand: %

List Price: H-10033N List Price: $14.52 List Price: $12.57 List Price: List Price:

137 IP/CC Plug 1-inch 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: A.Y. McDonald 30% Brand: FORD 20% Brand: %

List Price: H-10033N List Price: $15.33 List Price: $18.29 List Price: List Price:

138 IP/CC Plug 1 1/2-inch 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: A.Y. McDonald 30% Brand: FORD 20% Brand: %

List Price: H-10033N List Price: $27.27 List Price: $41.02 List Price: List Price:

139 IP/CC Plug 2-inch 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Mueller 0% Brand: A.Y. McDonald 30% Brand: FORD 20% Brand: %

List Price: H-10033N List Price: $35.35 List Price: $53.18 List Price: List Price:

140 3-inch PE x Flang 24 inch length 2 EA Brand: % Brand: Custom Pipe 46% Brand: Custom Pipe 53% Brand: US Pipe Fab 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $239.00 List Price: $320.00 List Price: List Price:

141 4-inch PE x Flang 24 inch length 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Custom Pipe 46% Brand: Custom Pipe 53% Brand: US Pipe Fab 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $198.00 List Price: $211.00 List Price: List Price:

142 6-inch PE x Flang 24 inch length 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Custom Pipe 46% Brand: Custom Pipe 53% Brand: US Pipe Fab 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $240.00 List Price: $260.00 List Price: List Price:

143 8-inch PE x Flang 24 inch length 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Custom Pipe 46% Brand: Custom Pipe 53% Brand: US Pipe Fab 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $316.00 List Price: $373.00 List Price: List Price:

144 10-inch PE x Flang 24 inch length 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Custom Pipe 46% Brand: Custom Pipe 53% Brand: US Pipe Fab 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $409.00 List Price: $484.00 List Price: List Price:
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6/10/19 Bid Summary

145 12-inch PE x Flang 24 inch length 4 EA Brand: % Brand: Custom Pipe 46% Brand: Custom Pipe 53% Brand: US Pipe Fab 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $581.00 List Price: $631.00 List Price: List Price:

146 4-inch Epoxy Coated MJ Cap W/2-inch FIP port 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Sigma / Tyler 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $89.00 List Price:$89.00 List Price: List Price:

147 6-inch Epoxy Coated MJ Cap W/2-inch FIP port 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Sigma / Tyler 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $128.00 List Price:$128.00 List Price: List Price:

148 8-inch Epoxy Coated MJ Cap W/2-inch FIP port 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Sigma / Tyler 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $174.00 List Price: $174.00 List Price: List Price:

149 10-inch Epoxy Coated MJ Cap W/2-inch FIP port 2 EA Brand: % Brand: Sigma / Tyler 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $215.00 List Price:$215.00 List Price: List Price:

150 12-inch Epoxy Coated MJ Cap W/2-inch FIP port 2 EA Brand: % Brand: Sigma / Tyler 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $294.00 List Price: $294.00 List Price: List Price:

151 4-inch Epoxy Coated MJ Plug W/ 2-inch FIP port 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Sigma / Tyler 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $98.00 List Price:$98.00 List Price: List Price:

152 6-inch Epoxy Coated MJ Plug W/ 2-inch FIP port 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Sigma / Tyler 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $148.00 List Price: $148.00 List Price: List Price:

153 8-inch Epoxy Coated MJ Plug W/ 2-inch FIP port 6 EA Brand: % Brand: Sigma / Tyler 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $199.00 List Price: $199.00 List Price: List Price:

154 10-inch Epoxy Coated MJ Plug W/ 2-inch FIP port 2 EA Brand: % Brand: Sigma / Tyler 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $314.00 List Price: $314.00 List Price: List Price:

155 12-inch Epoxy Coated MJ Plug W/ 2-inch FIP port 2 EA Brand: % Brand: Sigma / Tyler 68% Brand: Tyler 65% Brand: Tyler Union 20% Brand: %

List Price: List Price: $319.00 List Price: $319.00 List Price: List Price:

156 Pamrex Storm lids   (STORM) 80 EA Brand: % Brand: Pamrex 15% Brand: NO BID PAMREX % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: $502.00 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

157 Rexus Sewer lids  (SEWER) 80 EA Brand: % Brand: Rexus 15% Brand: NO BID REXUS % Brand: No Bid % Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: $322.00 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

158 4-inch SDR 26 pipe  (SEWER) 100 FT Brand: % Brand: Vinyl Tech 15% Brand: North American %23*currently Brand: North American 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: $1.13 Product No: 306041 List Price: $1.53 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

159 6-inch SDR 26 pipe  (SEWER) 100 FT Brand: % Brand: Vinyl Tech 15% Brand: North American %23*currently Brand: North American 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: $2.52 Product No: 306061 List Price: $3.345 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

160 8-inch SDR 26 pipe  (SEWER) 100 FT Brand: % Brand: Vinyl Tech 15% Brand: North American %23*currently Brand: North American 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: $4.54 Product No: 306081 List Price: $6.04 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

161 10-inch SDR 26 pipe  (SEWER) 100 FT Brand: % Brand: Vinyl Tech 15% Brand: North American %23*currently Brand: North American 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: $7.10 Product No: 306101 List Price: $9.44 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

162 12-inch SDR 26 pipe  (SEWER) 100 FT Brand: % Brand: Vinyl Tech 15% Brand: North American %23*currently Brand: North American 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: $10.20 Product No: 3060121 List Price: $13.50 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

163 Man Hole Barrel (Piranah) (SEWER) 12 EA Brand: % Brand: Piranah 0% Brand: NO BID MANHOLE MATERIAL % Brand: Old Castle 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

164 Man Hole Barrel (Old Castle) (SEWER) 12 EA Brand: % Brand: Piranah % Brand: NO BID MANHOLE MATERIAL % Brand: Old Castle 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

165 4-inch Mission Bands Repair Clamps (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Mission Bands 30% Brand: Fernco 35% Brand: Mission Clay 5% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: 1404045 List Price: $29.78 Product No: 505644RC List Price: $29.78 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

166 6-inch Mission Bands Repair Clamps (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Mission Bands 30% Brand: Fernco 35% Brand: Mission Clay 5% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: 1406032 List Price: $56.72 Product No: 505666RC List Price:$56.72 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

167 8-inch Mission Bands Repair Clamps (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Mission Bands 30% Brand: Fernco 35% Brand: Mission Clay 5% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: 1408020 List Price: $84.21 Product No: 505688RC List Price: $84.21 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

168 10-inch Mission Bands Repair Clamps (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Mission Bands 30% Brand: Fernco 35% Brand: Mission Clay 5% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: 1410026 List Price: $109.54 Product No: 50561010RC List Price: $109.54 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

169 12-inch Mission Bands Repair Clamps (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Mission Bands 30% Brand: Fernco 35% Brand: Mission Clay 5% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: 1412022 List Price: $134.09 Product No: 50561212RC List Price: $134.09 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

170 4-inch Max Adapters  (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Max Adapter 30% Brand: Gripper 20% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: 19200 List Price: $72.93 Product No: MAX4 List Price: $76.48 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

171 6-inch Max Adapters  (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Max Adapter 30% Brand: Gripper 20% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: 19210 List Price: $108.65 Product No: MAX6 List Price: $114.08 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

172 8-inch Max Adapters  (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Max Adapter 30% Brand: Gripper 20% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: 19215 List Price: $143.15 Product No: MAX8 List Price: $150.31 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

173 10-inch Max Adapters  (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Max Adapter 30% Brand: Gripper 20% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: 19220 List Price: $178.88 Product No: MAX10 List Price: $187.82 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

174 12-inch Max Adapters  (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Max Adapter 70% Brand: Gripper 20% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: 19225 List Price: $214.59 Product No: MAX12 List Price: $225.32 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

175 4-inch SDR T's (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H104 List Price: $125.93 Product No: 067004 List Price: $134.80 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

176 6-inch SDR T's (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H106 List Price: $172.37 Product No: 067006 List Price: $184.47 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

177 8-inch SDR T's (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H108 List Price: $358.11 Product No: 067008 List Price: $383.36 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

178 10-inch SDR T's (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H1010 List Price: $917.13 Product No: 067029 List Price: $1008.87 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

179 12-inch SDR T's (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H1212 List Price: $1,270.85 Product No: 067035 List Price: $1360.17 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

180 4-inch SDR Y's (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H3104 List Price: $129.08 Product No: 067204 List Price:$129.15 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

181 6-inch SDR Y's (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H306 List Price: $196.01 Product No: 067206 List Price: $209.94 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

182 8-inch SDR Y's (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H308 List Price: $445.68 Product No: 067208 List Price: $477.00 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

183 10-inch SDR Y's (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H3010 List Price: $1,143.73 Product No: 067210 List Price: $1170.35 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

184 12-inch SDR Y's (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H3012 List Price: $1,620.40 Product No: 067253 List Price: $1658.07 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

185 4-inch SDR Plugs  (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H1164 List Price: $43.14 Product No: 063734 List Price: $14.45 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

186 6-inch SDR Plugs  (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H1166 List Price: $86.92 Product No: 043736 List Price: $22.17 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

187 8-inch SDR Plugs  (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H1168 List Price: $153.49 Product No: 043738 List Price: $78.61 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

188 10-inch SDR Plugs  (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H1610 List Price: $295.02 Product No: 043740 List Price: $262.04 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

189 12-inch SDR Plugs  (SEWER) 50 EA Brand: % Brand: Royal 70% Brand: Multi-fittings 78.5% Brand: Multi Fittings 20% Brand: %

Product No: List Price: Product No: H11612 List Price: $351.70 Product No: 043741 List Price: $313.16 Product No: List Price: Product No: List Price:

Bid submitted by Corix is deemed non-responsive because the bid was not submitted on the "Revised" Bid Form and "Revised" Attachment B.
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