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OFFERED

ASP BATON 26' ASP, 26" - 52611 - No substitutions 92.27 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% 29.00 29.00 29.00
ASP BATON HOLDER ASP 52633 Scabbard 35.61 [NOTTOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 49.00 49.00 49.00
BADGE HOLDER Dutyman 5304 8.62 [NOTTOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX.. 3% Boston Badge holder 2.00 2.00 2.00
BALLISTIC HELMET Protech Protech 3A # 00207010 350.00 [NOT TOEX..3% _[NOT TO EX.. 3% A A A
BALLISTIC HELMET BAG #00020178 39.99 |NOTTOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% A A A
BALLISTIC HELMET SHIELD #000999863 99.75 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TO EX.. 3% A A A
BALLISTIC VEST Second Chance- SM01-3A00S-SM01 - No substitutions SMO1 DISTCONTINUED REPLACED WITH SM02 755.00 [NOT TOEX..3% _|[NOT TOEX..3% $749.00 $749.00 $749.00
BALLISTIC VEST COVERS Second Chance - No substitutions E1 COVER 55.00 [NOT TOEX.. 3% _|NOT TOEX..3% $89.00 $89.00 $89.00
BATON HOLDER Bianchi 7313 14.01 [NOT TOEX.3% |NOT TOEX. 3% $25.00 $25.00 $25.00
BATON RING Bianchi 7904 6.11 [NOTTOEX.. 3% [NOTTOEX..3% 12.00 12.00 12.00
BELT, DUTY BAM 7950, 1137 84.14 [NOTTOEX.3% |NOT TOEX..3% 67.00 67.00 67.00
BELT, DUTY Bianchi 7980 34.14 [NOTTOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 67.00 67.00 67.00
BELT, DUTY Bianchi Buckleless 7970 41.28 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% 79.00 79.00 79.00
BELT, DUTY Bianchi Sam Browne 7960 40.26 [NOT TOEX.. 3% |NOT TOEX..3% 77.00 77.00 77.00
BELT, DUTY Bianchi Nylon, 7200 29.05 [NOT TOEX..3% _|NOT TO EX.. 3% 55.00 55.00 55.00
BELT, DUTY Bianchi Accumold, Webgear 7210 21.40 [NOTTOEX.. 3% |NOTTOEX..3% 40.00 40.00 40.00
BELT, DUTY, UNDERBELT Bianchi 7205 16.81 [NOT TOEX..3% _|NOT TO EX.. 3% 65.00 65.00 65.00
BELT, PANTS Boston 6582 (buckle), 6530 (no buckle) 28.10 [NOTTOEX.. 3% |NOT TOEX..3% 9 /39. 9 /39. 9 /39.
BELT, PANTS Bianchi, Garrison B8V 19.62 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX..3% No longer made A A A
BELT, PANTS 5.11 TDU Belt 59552 (1.75") 12.48 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 8.00 8.00 8.00
BELT, PANTS 5.11 TDU Belt 59551 (1.5") 12.48 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% .00 .00 .00
BELT, PANTS Bianchi 7205 velcro $  16,081.00 [NOTTOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% .00 31.00 31.00
BELT, SWAT Bianchi Web Belt 7202, 1.75" $ 22.68 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% 43.00 43.00 43.00
BLOUSING BANDS Vanguard Coast Guard Boot Bands NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.00 3.00 3.00
BOOTS, MOTOR Dehner or All American 905L NO BID NO BID NO BID 5429.00 429.00 429.00
BOOTS, POLICE ACADEMY 5.11 A.T.A.C 8" Storm #12004 (mens) #12217 (women) $ 98.80 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TO EX.. 3% 139.00 39.00 39.00
CAP, BASEBALL, BLUE WITH PATCH (Civilian) Richardson 514 NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.00 6.00 6.00
CAP, DRESS Hankin NO BID NO BID NO BID 99.00 99.00 99.00
CHEST PROTECTOR, MFF Hatch Centurion CDX2500 (chest/shoulder) $ 95.85 [NOT TOEX.. 3% |NOT TO EX.. 3% A A A
DIGITAL RECORDER POUCH Bianchi 7303 $ 1350 [NOT TOEX. 3% [NOTTOEX.3% $24.00 $24.00 $24.00
EARPIEC KIT Braverman Comm. Astra# T20015L $ 51.60 |NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% A A A
ELBOW PADS, MFF Hatch Centurion NE35 NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
FLASHLIGHT & A/C CHARGER Streamlight Ultrastinger 77551 LED, AC bid spec 4716, 118.40 |[NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 69.00 69.00 69.00
FLASHLIGHT, CONE Streamlight yellow cone wand 78904 4.41 [NOTTOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% .00 .00 .00
FLASHLIGHT HOLDER Bianchi 7909 5.35 |[NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX.. 3% 1.00 1.00 1.00
FLASHLIGHT HOLDER, BIANCHI, #7311 Bianchi 7311 15.29 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 28.00 28.00 28.00
FLASHLIGHT, TLR -1 99.23 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% 39.00 39.00 39.00
FLEX CUFFS, MFF Plastic Zip-Tie, Safariland 8210, 10pk or individual 11.23 [NOT TOEX..3% _|[NOT TO EX.. 3% A A A
FOREARM PADS, MFF Hatch Centurion FP100 Forearm 15.74 |[NOTTOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% A A A
GEAR BAG, MFF Hatch M2 50.11 |NOT TOEX.. 3% _|NOT TO EX.. 3% A A A
GLOVES, MFF Hatch Centorian MP100 NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
GLOVES, WHITE PROCESSIONAL Vanguard white parade gloves NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.00 8.00 8.00
HANDCUFF CASE, DOUBLE Bianchi 7917 22.17 [NOTTOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% 43.00 43.00 43.00
HANDCUFF CASE, DOUBLE, WEBGEAR Bianchi 7317 18.60 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 34.00 34.00 34.00
HANDCUFF CASE, SINGLE Bianchi 7900 18.34 [NOT TOEX.3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 34.00 34.00 34.00
HANDCUFF CASE, SINGLE Bianchi 7300 15.80 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% $29.00 $29.00 $29.00
HANDCUFF KEY, HEAVY DUTY Bianchi Accumold 7916 14.27 [NOT TOEX..3% _|NOT TO EX.. 3% $25.00 $25.00 $25.00
HANDCUFF/MAG COMBO, PADDLEBACK Bianchi 45, Blk Leather -to fit 9mm, .40 & .45 cal Glock 35.93 |[NOTTOEX.. 3% |NOT TOEX.. 3% 68.00 68.00 68.00
HANDCUFFS, CHAINED Peerless Chrome - No 22.17 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% 34.00 34.00 34.00
HANDCUFFS, HINGED Peerless Chrome 31.23 [NOTTOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 48.00 48.00 48.00
HASHMARK Embroidered sleeve, various colors as needed NO BID NO BID NO BID No Charge - vour hashmarks 0.00 0.00 0.00
HAT, SWAT (CAMO) Richardson NO BID NO BID NO BID /A /A /A
HAT, CAMPAIGN Stration S-40DB NO BID NO BID NO BID $169.00 $169.00 $169.00
HAT, DRESS Lancaster NO BID NO BID NO BID midway 99.00 $99.00 $99.00
HAT, DRESS, CHIEF ONLY (CUSTOM SCRAMBLE) Lancaster NO BID NO BID NO BID midway $149.00 $149.00 $149.00
HELMET COVER, TRUSPEC Tru Spec 5937 13.75 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TO EX.. 3% no longer wearing

HELMET, MOTORCYCLE Shoei RJ-Platinum Air LE 442.74 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TO EX..3% $449.00 $449.00 $449.00
HOLSTER PANCAKE (for Glock 9mm, 40 & 45) Bianchi 60 / 83 35.93 |NOT TOEX.. 3% |NOT TOEX.. 3% no longer made

HOLSTER, GLOCK 6360 WITH LIGHT 94.47 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% Safariland 6360 69.00 69.00 69.00
HOLSTER, GLOCK Gen 5 6360 WITH LIGHT 9447 [NOTTOEX.. 3% |NOT TOEX..3% Safariland 6360 69.00 69.00 69.00
HOLSTER, SWAT, TACTICAL THIGH Safariland 6004 122.50 |[NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX.. 3% 59.00 59.00 59.00
HOOD, SWAT, BLK, NOMEX Hatch NH2500 Nomex Hood NO BID NO BID NO BID A

INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Large LT. Bars Vanguard NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.00 $11.00 $11.00
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Small LT. Bars Vanguard NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.00 $9.00 $9.00
INSIGNIA PINS, FIRE BUGLES Chief and Lt. NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.00 $28.00 $28.00
JACKET, BICYCLE, BLK ( Liner & Custom Print) Mocean 2150 Avalanche wireflect tape NO BID NO BID NO BID 239.00 239.00 239.00
JACKET, CNT Chameleon soft shell (black) 48099 UP A 2XL $ 85.77 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TO EX.. 3% 9.00 29.00 29.00
JACKET, DUTY Blauer 6120 NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.00 59.00 59.00
JACKET, GANG UNIT/RAID Royal Blue poly unlined windbreaker NO BID NO BID NO BID A A
JACKET, IKE Sinatra NO BID NO BID NO BID $299.00 $299.00
JACKET, INSTRUCTORS 5.11 48001 3-in-1 Parka (range red 477) UP TO 2XL $ 178.72 |[NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX.. 3% $249.00 $249.00
JACKET, OFFICE (women) Port Authority Pigue Fleece L222 NO BID NO BID NO BID 49.00 49.00
JACKET, OFFICE (men) Port Authority Pique Fleece F222 NO BID NO BID NO BID 49.00 49.00
JACKET, PATROL Blauer #9820 w/liner NO BID NO BID NO BID $339.00 $339.00
JACKET, POLICE ACADEMY WINDBREAKER NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.11 #48016 $64.00 $64.00
JACKET, RAID Royal Blue poly unlined windbreaker NO BID NO BID NO BID A A
KEEPERS, BAM, 4-PACK Bianchi 7906 7.64 |NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 6.00 6.00
KEEPERS, BIANCHINYLON Bianchi 7406 7.39 |[NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 4.00 4.00
KEY STRAP, BAM, SILENT Bianchi 7916 14.27 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 25.00 25.00
KEY STRAP, WEBGEAR Bianchi 7316 14.01 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 23.00 23.00
KNEE PADS, MFF Centurion KP250 knee pads 17.29 |[NOTTOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% A A
LANYARD (Whistle) Windsor Whistle NO BID NO BID NO BID .00 .00
MAG POUCH, DOUBLE Bianchi 7302 19.62 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 6.00 6.00
MAG POUCH, DOUBLE Bianchi Threat Ill, 7922 19.36 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 46.00 46.00
MAG POUCH, DOUBLE Bianchi 7902, 1138 24.20 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% 46.00 46.00
MAG POUCH, SINGLE (open top) 19.36 [NOTTOEX. 3% |NOTTOEX.3% no longer made
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MAG POUCH, SINGLE closed top) $ 23.95 [NOTTOEX. 3% |NOTTOEX.3% __|bianchi #7903 $28.00 $28.00 $28.00
NAMETAG METAL (LIST SIL/BLK, SIL/BLU, OR GLD/BLU) Classic BLACKINTON J1 NAME METAL NAME BAR $ 5.45 [NOT TOEX.. 3% _|NOT TOEX.. 3% $15.00 $15.00 $15.00
NAMETAPE, CLOTH Eddie NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.00 $8.00 $8.00
NUMBERTAPE, CLOTH, BLK/SIL Eddie NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.00 8.00 8.00
0.C. HOLDER Bianchi 7907 17.83 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% $32.00 32.00 32.00
0.C. HOLDER, BAM, OPEN TOP Bianchi 7908 14.52 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 27.00 27.00 27.00
0.C. HOLDER, NYLON - OPEN Bianchi 7308 10.95 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 9.00 9.00 9.00
0.C. HOLDER, WEBGEAR - CLOSED/NYLON Bianchi Accumold 7310 11.46 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 0.00 20.00 20.00
0.C. SPRAY, MK4 & MK4C Defence Technologies MKIV DEFTEC # 5049 10.16 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 8.00 8.00 8.00
0.C. SPRAY, SMALL MK3 Defence Technologies MKIII DEFTEC # 5039 9.01 [NOTTOEX..3% [NOTTOEX..3% 6.00 6.00 6.00
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, CAPT HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, GOLD HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, LT HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, PSO HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, SUBDUED HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, SWAT SUBDUED HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
PATCH, CLOTH, FIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
PATCH, CLOTH, SHIELD HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
PATCH, FLAG Schweizer Emblems NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.00 $4.00 $4.00
PATCH, MOTOR W HEEL, SET Schweizer Emblems NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.00 $10.00 $10.00
PATCHES, CLOTH 'POLICE' STAR Schweizer Emblems NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
PATCHES, DPS PATROL HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
PATCHES, EXPLORER HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
RADIO HOLDER! Bianchi 7923 25.48 [NOT TOEX. 3% _|NOT TOEX. 3% $49.00 $49.00 $49.00
RADIO HOLDER Bianchi Universal 7914S 30.83 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% $59.00 $59.00 $59.00
RADIO HOLDER! Bianchi 7324 19.36 [NOT TOEX. 3% [NOTTOEX.3% $36.00 $36.00 $36.00
RAIL MOUNTED LIGHT POUCH Bianchi 7327 43.12 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TO EX.. 3% no longer made

RAINGEAR, ANIMAL CONTROL Blauer 9691 (No "Police” on back) NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer made

RAINGEAR, JACKET Blauer 9691 NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer made

RAINGEAR, BLAUER, JACKET, CSO BLAUER 233R with hood NO BID NO BID NO BID 179.00 79.00 79.00
RAINGEAR, PANTS 5.11 48057 UP TO 2XL $ 71.66 [NOTTOEX.3% |NOT TOEX..3% Blauer 9134 79.00 79.00 79.00
RAINGEAR, HOOD Blauer (w/Jacket) NO BID NO BID NO BID 20.00 20.00 20.00
SHIN GUARDS, MFF Hatch Centurion TS70 $ 55.20 |NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% A A A
SHIRTS, ANIMAL CONTROL, S/S TAN W/W SHIRT Flying Cross 69R6604 NO BID NO BID NO BID $59.1 $59.00 $59.00
SHIRTS, ANIMAL CONTROL, L/S TAN W/W SHIRT Flying Cross 19W6604 NO BID NO BID NO BID $69.1 $69.00 $69.00
SHIRTS, ANIMAL CONTROL POLO Port Authority L455 (women) NO BID NO BID NO BID $26. $26.00 $26.00
SHIRTS, ANIMAL CONTROL POLO Port Authority K455 (men) NO BID NO BID NO BID $26. $26.00 $26.00
SHIRTS, ANIMAL CONTROL POLO L/S Port Authority K455LS (men) NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.1 29.00 29.00
SHIRTS, BIKE, POLO, S/S BLK W/ NAME EMBROIDERY 5.11 Performance Polo 71049 UP TO 2XL $ 29.31 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TO EX.. 3% 43.00 43.00 43.00
SHIRTS, BIKE, POLO, L/S BLK W/ NAME EMBROIDERY 5.11 Performance Polo 72049 UP TO 2XL $ 31.48 |NOTTOEX.. 3% |NOT TOEX.. 3% 46.00 46.00 46.00
SHIRTS, CADET, L-SLEEVE, TAN, CLOTH Dickies Poly Cotton RN20967 NO BID NO BID NO BID 574KH 32. 2.00 2.00
SHIRTS, CADET, S-SLEEVE, TAN, CLOTH Dickies Poly cotton NO BID NO BID NO BID 1574KH $26. $26.00 $26.00
SHIRTS, CPA/AN.CONTROL, L-SLEEVE, TAN, POLY Flying Cross 19W6604 NO BID NO BID NO BID $59. $59.00 $59.00
SHIRTS, CPA/ANM.CONTROL, S-SLEEVE, TAN, POLY Flying Cross 69R6604 NO BID NO BID NO BID $69.1 69.00 69.00
SHIRTS, CSIK-9, L-SLEEVE, BLU, BDU Blauer 8703 NO BID NO BID NO BID Blauer 8831 $59. 59.00 59.00
SHIRTS, CSI/K-9, S-SLEEVE, BLU, BDU Blauer 8713 NO BID NO BID NO BID Blauer 8731 $59. 59.00 59.00
SHIRTS, EXPLORER, L-SLEEVE, LITE BLUE Blauer 8431 NO BID NO BID NO BID Elbeco 87 $44. 44.00 44.00
SHIRTS, EXPLORER, S-SLEEVE, LITE BLUE Blauer 8421 NO BID NO BID NO BID elbeco 868 $39. 39.00 39.00
SHIRTS, FIRE COMMAND, W HITE, L/S Flying Cross 45W6600 NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing

SHIRTS, FIRE COMMAND, W HITE, S/S Flying Cross 95R6600 NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing

SHIRTS, FIRE NOMEX S/S Nomex 705MN NO BID NO BID NO BID fscOmn 29. 29.00 29.00
SHIRTS, FIRE NOMEX L/S Nomex 700MN NO BID NO BID NO BID fsc2mn 09. 09.00 09.00
SHIRTS, FIRE PREVENTION, NOMEX L/S Nomex 700MN NO BID NO BID NO BID fsc2mn 09.f 09.00 09.00
SHIRTS, FIRE PREVENTION, NOMEX S/S Nomex 705MN NO BID NO BID NO BID fscOmn 29 29.00 29.00
SHIRTS, INCLEMENT WEATHER Blauer 8703 NO BID NO BID NO BID blauer 8831 59. 59.00 59.00
SHIRTS, MANAGER,RECORDS & DISPATCH, L/S Elbeco Paragon Plus 811, 867 NO BID NO BID NO BID 39. 39.00 39.00
SHIRTS, MANAGER,RECORDS & DISPATCH, S/S Elbeco Paragon Plus 801, 877 NO BID NO BID NO BID 44 44.00 44.00
SHIRTS, MFF, L/S, BLK Propper 2412 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.11#72002 $64.1 64.00 64.00
SHIRTS, NVI/PEO, L/S, LIGHT BLUE Flying Cross 45W6625 NO BID NO BID NO BID $69.1 69.00 69.00
SHIRTS, NVI/PEO, S/S, LIGHT BLUE Flying Cross 95R6625 NO BID NO BID NO BID $59.1 $59.00 $59.00
SHIRTS, PATROL, L-SLEEVE, 100% WOOL Flying Cross 20W9586 NO BID NO BID NO BID Elbeco 437 $99.| $99.00 $99.00
SHIRTS, PATROL, L-SLEEVE, POLYESTER, Flying Cross 48W6686 NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing

SHIRTS, PATROL, S-SLEEVE, 100% WOOL Flying Cross 70R9586 NO BID NO BID NO BID Elbeco 4237 $89.00 $89.00 $89.00
SHIRTS, PATROL, S-SLEEVE, POLYESTER, Flying Cross 98R6686 NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing

SHIRTS, POLICE ACADEMY (Light Blue) Horace Small (Red Cap) Model SP56mB7 NO BID NO BID NO BID RedKap 29.00 29.00 29.00
SHIRT, POLO 5.11 Performance Polo 71049 UP TO 2XL $ 29.31 [NOTTOEX.. 3% |NOTTOEX..3% 43.00 43.00 43.00
SHIRT, POLO 5.11 Performance Polo 61165 UP TO 2XL $ 29.31 [NOTTOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% 43.00 43.00 43.00
SHIRT, POLO 5.11 Performance Polo 72049 UP TO 2XL $ 3148 [NOTTOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 46.00 46.00 46.00
SHIRT, POLO Port Authority L500, Womens (S/S) NO BID NO BID NO BID 6. 6.00 6.00
SHIRT, POLO Port Authority L500LS, Womens (L/S) NO BID NO BID NO BID $22. $22.00 $22.00
SHIRT, POLO Port Auhtority K500LS Men (L/S) NO BID NO BID NO BID $22. $22.00 $22.00
SHIRT, POLO Port Authority L420 NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.00 9.00
SHIRT, POLO Port Auhtority K420 NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.00 9.00
SHIRT, POLO Port Auhotiry L568 NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.00 9.00
SHIRT, POLO, DISPATCH/ PROPERTY(women) 5.11 Helios 61305 women UP TO 2XL 32.57 |NOT TOEX..3% [NOTTOEX. 3% 49.00 49.00 49.00
SHIRT, POLO, DISPATCH/ PROPERTY(men) 5.11 Helios 41192 men UP TO 2XL 32.57 |NOTTOEX.. 3% |NOT TOEX.. 3% 49.00 49.00 49.00
SHIRTS, POLO PROESSIONAL 5.11 Professional Polo 41060 S/S UP TO 2XL 29.31 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% 43.00 43.00 43.00
SHIRTS, POLO PROESSIONAL 5.11 Professional Polo 42056 L/S UP TO 2XL 33.65 |NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX.. 3% 46.00 46.00 46.00
SHIRTS, RECORDS, L-SLEEVE, WHITE Elbeco 801/877 NO BID NO BID NO BID 44.00 44.00 44.00
SHIRTS, RECORDS, S-SLEEVE, WHITE Elbeco NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.00 39.00 39.00
SHIRTS, SWAT, COMBAT Tru-Spec Combat Shirt 2550 NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing

SHIRTS, SWAT, STRYKE TDU LS RAPID 72071, Stryke TDU LS Rapid shirt (color: black or green) $ 60.80 [NOTTOEX.. 3% |NOT TOEX..3% 72071 $79.00 $79.00 $79.00
SHIRTS, SWAT, RIPSTOP TDU L/S 72002, Ripstop TDU L/S Shirt, (Color: black or green) $ 35.83 |NOT TOEX..3% [NOT TO EX.. 3% no longer wearing

SHIRTS, TAC, L-SLEEVE, BLK, BDU, W/NUMBERTAPE Proper Ripstop NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing

SHIRTS, UAS, TDU, DRK NAVY 5.11 Llong sleeve TDU #72002, dark navy $ 85.83 [NOTTOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% $64.00 $64.00 $64.00
SHOES, BIKE Magnum or Rocky, Quarter Length NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
SHORTS, BIKE, BLK, BDU Mocean, TR601 NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
SHOULDER PADS, MFF/CHEST PROTECTOR Hatch, Centurion $ 95.85 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% A A A

SL 20X BATTERY Streamlight - for SL-20X $ 29.01 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TO EX..3% $45.00 $45.00 $45.00
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SL 20X W/AC CHARGER Streamlight - for SL-20X STREAMLIGHT 20701 $ 108.22 |[NOT TOEX.. 3% |NOT TOEX.. 3% $149.00 $149.00 $149.00
SWAT, BALACLAVA Blackhawk, Nomex #HDC19575 BLACKHAWK # 333005 $ 13.85 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% N/A N/A N/A
SWAT, COVERED COMP LIGHT HOLDER Bianchi 9711 SHOULD BE PART NUMBER # 7911 $ 17.83 [NOTTOEX. 3% |NOTTOEX.3% no longer made
SWAT, FIELD JACKET Propper, No Patches NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing
SWAT, FLASHLIGHT Streamlight 75013 $ 84.00 [NOT TO EX..3% _|NOT TO EX.. 3% not correct # $139.00 $139.00 $139.00
SWAT, GLOVES Hatch KSG500, Kevlar Shooting $ 27.77 [NOT TOEX. 3% _|NOT TO EX.. 3% A A A
SWAT, JACKET Gortex Hatch MT2000 NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
SWAT, MAGAZINE POUCH Bianchi Accumold, Close Top 7302 $ 19.62 [NOT TOEX. 3% [NOTTOEX.3% $36.00 $36.00 $36.00
SWAT, MAGAZINE POUCH Bianchi Accumold, Open Top 7320 $ 17.58 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% $32.00 $32.00 $32.00
TIE CLIP Gold or Silver, Vanguard NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.00 $6.00 $6.00
TIE CLIP, SUNNYVALE Hook fast NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.00 $9.00 $9.00
TIE, BLACK S. Broome_Clip-on NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.00 $8.00 $8.00
TIE, BOWTIE, BLUE, SOUTHER STYLE, RECORDS S. Broome Snap-on NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing
TIE, NAVY, PATROL S. Broome_Clip-on NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.0( $8.00 $8.00
TROUSERS, ANIM. CTRL, BLACK Blauer 8810 NO BID NO BID NO BID blauer 8831 $59.00 $59.00 $59.00
TROUSERS, BICYCLE, BLK Mocean, Blk 2050 NO BID NO BID NO BID Pt/Short Combo #2058 $99.00 $99.00 $99.00
TROUSERS, CADET, TAN, CLOTH Dickies 640 NO BID NO BID NO BID 874KH $32.00 $32.00 $32.00
TROUSERS, CPA, TAN, POLYESTER Fechheimer 46351 NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing
TROUSERS, CSIK-9, BLU BDU'S Blauer 8810 NO BID NO BID NO BID blauer 8831 59.0( 59.00 59.00
TRPUSERS, FIRE NOMEX Nomex 402MN (men) 401MN (women) NO BID NO BID NO BID FP52MN No Ladies 129.00 129.00 129.00
TROUSERS, FIRE PREVENTION, NOMEX Nomex 402MN (men) 401MN (women) NO BID NO BID NO BID FP52MN_No Ladies 129.00 129.00 129.00
TROUSERS, MANAGER, RECORDS & DISPATCH Flying Cross SUMTRSO01 NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing $99.0( $99.00 $99.00
TROUSERS, MOTOR BRITCHES Sinatra NO BID NO BID NO BID United 10303 $289.00 $289.00 $289.00
TROUSERS, PATROL, 100% WOOL Fechheimer 32289 NO BID NO BID NO BID $99.0 $99.00 $99.00
TROUSERS, PATROL, POLYESTER Fechheimer 38289 NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing
TROUSERS, PROPERTY, 5.11 TATICAL PRO 5.11 Stryke Pant 64386 (women), 74369 (men) $ 53.74 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TO EX..3% $84.00 $84.00 $84.00
TROUSERS, POLICE ACADMEY TDU 5.11 TDU black NO BID NO BID NO BID $59.00 $59.00 $59.00
TROUSERS, POLICE ACADMEY NO BID NO BID NO BID $59.00 $59.00 $59.00
TROUSERS, RECORDS, BLU, POLY/WOOL Edwards 8783-07 or Flying Cross 39400W or 39400 NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing
TROUSERS, SWAT TAC, BLK, BDU'S, SIZE-SPECIFIC 74068 XPRT Tactical Pant (color: black or green) 141.15 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX..3% $199.00 $199.00 $199.00
TROUSERS, UAS, TDU, DARK NAVY 5.11 TDU Pant #74003, dark navy 86.37 [NOT TOEX.3% |NOT TOEX..3% $59.00 $59.00 $59.00
WHISTLE, BLACK Acme, Blk Plastic 4.40 [NOTTOEX..3% [NOT TOEX..3% $4.00 $4.00 $4.00
WHISTLE, CHROME Acme, Chrome 440 [NOTTOEX.3% |NOTTOEX.3% $9.00 $9.00 $9.00
WINDBREAKER, CHAPLAIN, W/PATCHES Blue Polyester windbreaker, no lining NO BID NO BID NO BID no longer wearing
MILPITAS-ONLY ITEMS NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TO EX.. 3%
ASP BATON HOLDER, SWAT Safariland Black Plastic $ 19.81 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 49.00 49.00 49.00
BELT, SWAT Trouser Bianchi $ 16.81 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX. 3% 9.00 9.00 9.00
BELT, SWAT Utiity Belt Bianchi NO BID NO BID NO BID 29.00 29.00 29.00
BOOTS, MOTOR SIDI Canyon Gortex NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
BOOTS, SWAT Under Armor, Valsetz $ 81.47 [NOTTOEX. 3% |NOTTOEX..3% A A A
CAP, SWAT Utility Cap Condor NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
FLASHLIGHT, SWAT Streamlight 74114 STREAMLIGHT # 74414 $ 88.00 [NOTTOEX.. 3% |NOTTOEX..3% not correct # A A A
FLASHBANG HOLDER, SWAT Safariland/5.11 $ 12.95 [NOTTOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX..3% A A A
GLOVES, SWAT MecanixP.l.G. NO BID NO BID NO BID A A A
HANDCUFF HOLDER, SWAT Safariland/5.11 $ 12.95 [NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TOEX.. 3% A A A
HANDCUFF/MAG COMBO, PADDLEBACK Bianchi 45, Bk Leather -to fit S&W M&P .40 $ 25.73 [NOT TOEX.. 3% _|NOT TO EX.. 3% $68.00 $68.00 $68.00
HAT, SWAT Proper Boonie Hat Multicam NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.00 $18.00 $18.00
HOLSTER PANCAKE (for S&W M&P .40) $ 29.56 [NOT TOEX..3% _|NOT TO EX.. 3% A A A
HOLSTER, S&W M&P .40 $ 37.20 |NOTTOEX..3% |NOT TOEX..3% A A A
HOLSTER, SWAT, TACTICAL THIGH Safariland Thigh-rig $ 125568 |[NOT TOEX. 3% |NOT TO EX.. 3% 69.00 69.00 69.00
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Large SGT. Chevrons NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.00 1.00 1.00
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Small SGT. Chevrons NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.00 9.00
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Large Captain Bars NO BID NO BID NO BID 0 11.00 11.00
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Small Captain Bars NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.00 9.00
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Large Asst. Chief Stars NO BID NO BID NO BID 0 11.00 11.00
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Small Asst. Chief Stars NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.00 $9.00
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Large Chief Stars NO BID NO BID NO BID 0 $21.00 $21.00
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Small Chief Stars NO BID NO BID NO BID 0 $19.00 $19.00
JACKET, SWAT MGS Field Jacket w/liner NO BID NO BID NO BID A
JACKET, MOTOR TourMaster Flex LE Safety Jacket NO BID NO BID NO BID $299.00 $299.00
MAG POUCH, SWAT Pro-Tech, Safariland, 5.11 $ 13.88 [NOT TOEX..3% |NOT TO EX.. 3% A
O.C. HOLDER, SWAT Safariland Tall OC holder $ 13.88 |[NOT TOEX.3% |NOT TO EX. 3% A
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, CHIEF NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.00 $8.00
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, ASST CHIEF NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.00 $8.00
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, SGT NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.00 $8.00
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, POLICE OFFICER NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.00 $8.00
RADIO HOLDER, SWAT Protech $ 19.44 [NOTTOEX.3% |NOT TOEX. 3% A A
RAINGEAR, SWAT Poncho NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, CITIZEN VOLUNTEER, L-SLEEVE, WHITE, CLOTH Elbeco 801/877 NO BID NO BID NO BID $44.00 $44.00
SHIRTS, CITIZEN VOLUNTEER, S-SLEEVE, WHITE, CLOTH Elbeco NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.00 $39.00
SHIRTS, PATROL, L-SLEEVE, 100% WOOL Elbeco NO BID NO BID NO BID $99.00 $99.00
SHIRTS, PATROL, S-SLEEVE, 100% WOOL Elbeco NO BID NO BID NO BID $89.00 $89.00
SHIRTS, SWAT, COMBAT Proper Multicam NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.00 $79.00
TROUSERS, MOTOR BRITCHES Flying Cross NO BID NO BID NO BID United 10303 $289.00 $289.00
TROUSERS, PATROL, 100% WOOL Elbeco NO BID NO BID NO BID Flving Cross 32289 $99.00 $99.00
TROUSERS, SWAT TAC, BLK, BDU'S, SIZE-SPECIFIC Proper Multicam NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.00 $79.00
UTILITY BAG, SWAT 5.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID $274.00 $274.00
BADGE HOLDER, BFP AND ADMIN Black leather, designed for use with a shield-type badge, with

attached belt clip $ 12.00 |125 125 N/A N/A N/A
BADGE MORNING BAND shoulder to navel $ 2.00 |2 2 NO CHARGE [NO CHARGE [NO CHARGE
BELT, BDU FIRE All black, with no contrasting colors or trim. Black or gunmetal-

colored hardware NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A N/A
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CAP, DRESS MILPITAS FIRE Traditional Bell Crown-style fire cap with appropriate fire cap
piece
O Approved Manufacturers: Bayly, Midway, Marlow White
5
O Fire Chief
O White vinyl top, white band with gold metallic strap, 5-
crossed-bugle gold strap pins
and gold bullion decorated on a black high gloss visor.
O Deputy Chief
O White vinyl top, black band with gold metallic strap 3-
crossed-bugle gold strap pins
and gold bullion decorated on a high gloss black visor.
O Battalion Chief
O White vinyltop, black band with gold metallic strap, 2-
crossed-bugle gold strap pins
and high gloss black visor.
O Captain
O White vinyltop, black band with silver metallic strap, 2-
parallel-bugle silver strap
pins and high gloss black visor
O Engineer, Firefighter and Administration
O Navy blue wooltop and band with black patent leather strap,
silver FD strap pins
and high gloss visor
NO BID NO BID NO BID $99.00 $99.00 $99.00
COLLAR INSIGNIA CLASS "A" SHIRT O Chief Officers NO BID NO BID NO BID 20-28 20-28 20-28
COLLAR INSIGNIA COAT O 1" collar insignia to be worn %" from front and bottom of the NO BID! NO BID NO BID $20.00 $20.00 $20.00
DRESS JACKET OTHER PERSONNEL FIRE Flying Cross Model # X917B89-04, 100% Wool, style # 13754.
U.S. Navy
Officer-style double-breasted with (6) silver buttons designating
appropriate
rank
NO BID NO BID NO BID $369.00 $369.00 $369.00
DRESS JACKET CHIEF OFFICERS FIRE Flying cross Model # X917B89-04, 100% Wool, style # 13754.
U.S. Navy Officer-style double-breasted with (6) gold buttons
designating appropriate rank
NO BID NO BID NO BID $369.00 $369.00 $369.00
DRESS SLACKS Flying Cross Model #SFFDTRSO2 100% Navy Blue Wool,
standard belt loops and pockets
NO BID NO BID NO BID $99.00 $99.00 $99.00
NO BID NO BID NO BID
HAT, BASEBALL Department logo NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A N/A
HAT, COLD WEATHER CAP Plain, navy, knit or fleece, cuffed or uncuffed, with approved
Milpitas Fire Department
logo embroidery to be forward facing
NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A N/A
HAT, TILLEY Navy Tilley Endurable Hat Style #T-3 with approved Milpitas N/A N/A
Fire Department logo
embroidery
NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A
JACKET, BDU FIRE Matching set to BDU pants. Milpitas Fire Department patch on
both shoulders 1” down from shoulder
seam. Name tape over left pocket.
NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A N/A
JACKET, FLEECE FIRE Navy Blue. Fleece Jacket 5.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID $119.00 $1.119.00 $119.00
JACKET, STATION WORK JACKET FIRE Lion™ # 3134 or uniform committee approved equivalent,
midnight blue, liner optional,
all-weather, short-waist jacket, uniform patch shall be sewn 1"
down from shoulder
seam. NO BID NO BID NO BID Liberty $119.00 $119.00 $119.00
SHIRTS, DRESS MILPITAS FIRE Flying Cross Style #35W54 [J Standard long-sleeve poly-
cotton white dress shirt, plain collar, barrel cuff, military
creases, pleated pocket and epaulets
O No button down or tab-type collars
O Patches on dress shirt
NO BID NO BID NO BID $69.00 $69.00 $69.00
SHIRTS, FIRE Wool: Flying Cross, dark blue, long or short sleeve NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, JOB-SHIRT MILPITAS FIRE 5.11 Tactical style # 72321 or Game Job Shirt
style # 811
O Navy, 11.6 oz. poly-cotton fleece, % zip, side pockets, right
chest radio pocket with
Velcro, radio microphone pockets at both shoulders and pen
pocket on left sleeve.
MFD text logo embroidered on left chest. Last name in all
capital letters embroidered on
right chest with Helvetica 7/8™ font.
NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.00 $79.00 $79.00
SLEEVE BRAID MILPITAS FIRE Gold, white or black Rices nylon braid article 7100 Stripes for
respective ranks as follows:
O Chief Five /4" Gold Braid Stripes (1%47)
O Deputy Chief  Three %" Gold Braid Stripes (1}47)
O Battalion Chief Two %” Gold Braid Stripes (1/2")
O Captain ~ Two %" White Braid Stripes (1%2")
O Engineer  Single Black Braid
O Firefighter ~ Single Black Braid
O Administrative No Braid NO BID nosD nosD $40.00 $40.00 $40.00
TIE CLASPS, MILPITAS FIRE Tie clasps must be appropriate for public display on dress
uniform (Gold for chief
officers; silver for all other personnel) NO BID 08D 08D $6.00 $6.00 $6.00
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TIE, BLACK MILPITAS FIRE Black wool, cotton or Dacron, (1%") minimum, (2%")
maximum width. Clip-on type if
d to iate response, type
ffrot NO BID nosiD NosD $8.00 $8.00 $8.00
TROUSERS, BDU FIRE 5.11 Tactical Taclite Pro Pants or 5.11 Company Cargo Pants,
Navy Blue NO BID NO BID NO BID $59.00 $59.00 $59.00
ALTERATIONS/REPAIRS N/A NIA NIA
Cut tails N/A N/A NA $12.00 $12.00 $12.00
Dart back N/A NA NA 20.00 $20.00 $20.00
Hash marks N/A NIA NIA A A A
Re-hem pants N/A NA NA O CHARGE [NO CHARGE [NO CHARGE
Remove hash marks N/A NA N/A custom tailor time
Remove patches N/A NA NA custom tailor time
Sew patches - jacket N/A N/A N/A
Sew patches - shirt N/A NIA NIA
Shorten crotch N/A NIA N/A 5
Shorten sleeves N/A N/A N/A 5
Take in sides N/A N/A N/A 0
Take in sides & sleeves N/A NIA NIA 0
Take in waist/let out waist N/A N/A N/A 5
Zippers in customer's garments N/A N/A N/A 0
Custom Alterations Per 1/2 hour N/A NIA N/A 0
Per hour N/A NIA NIA 40
* No charge for patches or star N/A N/A N/A
* All uniforms must have employee ID#
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