
9/1/2020 Revised Bid Summary

Bid    

Item 

No.

Description

UOM

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Cost per UOM Extended Cost Cost per UOM Extended Cost Cost per UOM Extended Cost

1.       Crushed Granite/Fine 1/4” TONS 2600 $34.25 $89,050.00 $50.59 $177,065.00 NO BID NO BID

2.       Crushed Granite/Medium 3/8” TONS 3500 $33.00 $115,500.00 $50.59 $177,065.00 NO BID NO BID

3. Aggregate Base (Recycled) ¾ Class 2 TONS 3200 $17.75 $56,800.00 $15.16 $48,512.00 $21.33 $68,256.00

4. Drain Rock 11/2” TONS 3000 $33.25 $99,750.00 $45.19 $135,570.00 $43.67 $131,010.00

5. Cold Mix/Cut Back TONS 300 $130.00 $39,000.00 $147.99 $44,397.00 NO BID NO BID

BID TOTAL $400,100.00 $582,609.00 $199,266.00

Other Bid Items

1.       Permanent Asphalt Cold Patch 50 Ib. BAG EA 300 $0.00 $0.00 $17.06 $5,118.00 NO BID NO BID

2.       Permanent Asphalt Cold Patch 60 Ib. BAG EA 300 $12.50 $3,750.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

Notes *West Coast Sand & Gravel Products supplied samples for City bid items 1 & 2 did not meet City approval.

West Coast Sand & Gravel

9411 Elder Creek Rd

Sacramento, CA 95829

Rick Santa Cruz

800-522-0282 ext 1

Graniterock

1900 Quarry Rd

Aromas, CA 95004

Tom Treanor

831-234-9300

Stevens Creek Quarry

12100 Stevens Canyon Rd

Cupertino, CA 95014

Mark Mallin

408-253-2512

Address
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